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Comes now, Cosho, Humphrey, Greener & Welsh, P.A., Applicant, pursuant to 11
U.S.C. §330. 331 and Rule 2016 of the U.S. Bankruptcy Rules and hereby moves this Court for
an Order authorizing payment of their fees and costs as follows:

A. INFORMATION ABOUT THE APPLICANT AND THE APPLICATION:

1. Significant dates of filing.

a. Date the Bankruptcy Petition was filed: July 21, 1999,

b. The Application requesting approval of employment was filed: November 18,
1999;

¢. The Order approving employment of Applicant was entered by the Court on:
The Order has not been entered, a hearing on the Application has been

scheduled for December 7, 1999,
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d. The identity of the party represented in this proceeding: Applicant has
represented the Debtor, among other Plaintiffs in litigation instituted in the
State of Idaho known as Hernandez, et.al. v. State Farm Fire and Casualty,
et.al. filed in the District Court of the Fourth Judicial District in and for the
State of Idaho, County of Ada, Case No. 97-601. Debtor is one of six
plaintiffs in that State Court litigation against State Farm. Once Applicant
was advised of the bankruptcy, it contacted the Trustee who has agreed to
employ it as special counsel. The claims in the estate do not exceed the
recovery so Debtor also continues to be a real party in interest.

. The date services were first commenced: Applicant commenced working for
the Debtor on or about January 6, 1996 under agreement with the Goicoechea
law offices that applicant would represent Debtor, among other Plaintiffs
under a contingency fee agreement wherein Applicant and Goicoechea Law
Office would collectively receive 33 1/3 % of any recovery together with
reimbursement of all out of pocket expenses. Applicant further agreed to split
the contingency fee between them.

f.  Subsequent to the bankruptcy being filed, Applicant was notified of the
bankruptcy and has filed an Application, Nunc Pro Tunc seeking employment
by the Chapter 7 Trustee as to the litigation against State Farm Insurance
Company. Also, there is currently pending a Motion to Compromise
Controversy pending before the Bankruptcy Court wherein the litigation with
State Farm is settled, and the Debtor, among all the Plaintiffs’ will receive a
distribution. State Farm has requested, as part of the contract, that the amount

of the distribution be held confidential. The net proceeds to be received by
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the Debtor, however, even after payment of attorney fees and costs are
sufficient to pay all scheduled claims of creditors and costs of administration
in this case.

g. Applicant is seeking compensation under the Bankruptcy Code under 11
U.S.C.§ 331 and Rule 2016 of the U.S. Bankruptcy Rules.

2. Terms and Conditions of Emplovment.

a. Applicant was employed under an agreement with the Debtor, among other
Plaintiffs, as well as the Goicoechea Law Office to share a contingency fee
based on 33 '/3% of any total recovery together with payment of all
reasonable costs incurred by Applicant over and above the 33 '/3 %;

b.  Source of Compensation: Award in settlement from State Farm Insurance
Co.;

c. Identity and existence in terms controlling the use of any retainer received
from any party for providing services in the case: N/A;

d. Budgetary or limitations on fees: N/A;

3. Applicants professionals working on the case.

a. The names and hourly rates of applicants, professionals and para-legals who
are requesting compensation are as follows: Attached to the Application are
fees and costs incurred by the Applicant in the Ilitigation. Since they
commenced representing the Debtor, among the other Plaintiffs in the
litigation as Applicants attorneys are working under a contingency fee
arrangement, the hourly fee 1s not relevant, other than to show the substantial
time and expense incurred on behalf of the Debtor, the Trustee and the other

Plaintifts in the litigation. The hours incurred are attached hereto to
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demonstrate the extensive hours required in litigating this issue. As the
Debtor only represented one-sixth of the Plaintiffs the total fees incurred,
when reviewed on an hourly basis, would have to be allocated among the
Plaintiffs. A reasonable allocation would be the total fees divided by the
number of Plaintiffs. As shown by the attached Exhibit “A™ the total fees and
costs incurred from January 6, 1996 through November 10, 1999 exceed the
sum of $94,391.00. Therefore the Court may calculate that the contingency
fee requested for fees incurred in representing the Debtor as well as the other
Plaintiffs as well as special counsel for the Trustee justify the contingency
award of 33 '/3% of the recovery against State Farm.

b. Explanation of any changes in hourly rates: N/A;

c. Compensation comparable to other practitioners: The requested compensation
based on 33 '/3% together with reimbursement of all costs is in conformity
with the standard rates charged within the community and are in accordance
with the level and experience and expertise of the attorney.

4. Fee request:

a. Application for interim or final compensation: This is an application is for a
final compensation. Applicant requests that this Court enter an Order
authorizing them to receive compensation based on their contingency fee and
out of pocket costs from the settlement with State Farm. The only issue which
must be addressed by this Court is whether Debtor and the estate should
compensate Applicant for that portion of the settlement related to the Debtor’s
settlement with State Farm Insurance Co. Applicant seeks an order of this

Court authorizing Applicant to take the initial compensation from the
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f.

settlement and remit the Debtor’s net portion, as described in the Settlement
Agreement, to the Debtor and the Chapter 7 estate.

Dates of previous orders concerning interim compensation or expenses for this
Applicant: N/A;

Amount of compensation previously requested: N/A;

Amount of compensation previously allowed by the Court: N/A;

Amount of compensation and expenses paid to date: N/A;

Amount of allowed compensation remaining unpaid to date: N/A;

5. Approval by the Trustee.

a. Has the Trustee been given the opportunity to review the pending application:

The Trustee has been aftorded the opportunity to review the contingency fee

agreement as well as the confidential settlement agreement.

b. Has the Debtor-In-Possession approved the requested amount: N/A;

6. Is application filed less than 120 days after the Order for Relief or after a prior

application?: The Application 1s filed in conjunction with the proposed 9019 compromise motion

which is filed before this Court.

7. Period of the services or expenses covered by the application: January 6, 1996 to

date.

8. Also attached hereto as Exhibit “B” are all the costs and fees incurred in this

proceeding by Applicant and Goicoechea’s office which total $38,085.00 for Cosho, Humphrey,

Greener & Welsh and Goicoechea’s office at $6,329.00. These are the total costs incurred for all

the Plaintiffs in the litigation. A fair allocation of those costs would be to allocate one-sixth of

the total to the Debtor or $7,402.33. Again, the costs and fees attached hereto are all the costs

incurred by the Applicant in the litigation.
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B. CASE STATUS:

1. Status of this Chapter 7 Proceeding: Based on the disclosures of the Debtor in his
Chapter 7 Schedules, there appear to be sufficient monies from the settlement

proceeds to be received by Debtor to pay all claims including administrative claims in

full.

WHEREFORE, Applicant requests that this Court authorize the payment to Applicant
and Goicoechea Law Offices based on a contingency award of 33 /3% plus out of pocket costs
of $7,402.33. As numerous non-debtor plaintiffs are involved Applicant requests that the net
award described in the confidential settlement Agreement be delivered to the Trustee, which net
award is less the contingency fee and costs.

DATED this 29 day of November, 1999.

COSHO, HUMPHREY, GREENER
" & WERSH, P.A.
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Walker; memorandum te trial team regarding
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E |t .80 144.0C 7750 Conference with Richard Greener regarding
status of case and discovery scnedule
E Al C.60 10&.00C 7754 Conference with Dick Greener; review memo frow
Dick Greener
B u 0,50 27.50 TThe  Conference with N.Hoplins regarding
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reguest for production; memorandum to fiie;
file crganlzation
B i G. 36 55.0C 7767 Conference with Nancy Hopkins regarding case
E il S.ad 2z .06 1772 Cornferences witn N.Hopkins and P.Edwards
regarding file management and organization;
assist MN.Hopkins in location of documents
21 1 2o 5054 Letter to LaRue for documents and starvemenl
tapes; draf: Tuest for production and
interrcgartories to defendants
B Al 0.70 120.0C 7734 Review Preliminary Litigation Plan prepared o
Mancy Hopkinz
E Al .10 I 7791 Telephons call to Bruce Skauyg regarding Star.
farm documents
B 1 [ 140,00 TH0L  Telephone conterence with W. Savard, Memorarium
to fiie regarding new trlal dacs
B U .90 157,50 1729 Finalize plaintiff'’s fourth set of subpoenas;
craft plaintiff's sixth request for producti
E il C.sl E2.50 7672 Final WIS and RIFP to Def.
2 u 050 5%, 50 7673 Final WI& and RFF to Del.
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regarding State Farm documents Lo be picked g
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Conference with Nancy J. Hopkins-Garrett;
conference with Zarolyr Baldino: researched ana
craanized documents Icr photocopying and
presentation to expert witness; conference with
KT.

Conference with Kathy Corzigan; assist with
deposition transcript retrieval Zcr copying
Meet with Wayne Soward, expert witness., mem:
to file and preparation of documents for revisw
by expert.

File management. Photocopied, organized andg
indexed documents for delivery to expert
wWitness,

Fils organization and indexing; copied and
organized documents for delivery to expert
witnesses.

Continued indexing documents and organizing
file. Brougnt peck filing current.

Completed file organization and indering of

pleadings.

Tile management.

File Management.

File management.

T1le managemsnt.

Telephone conference with Wayne Sowarc ¥ 2
regarding evaluation of matter; file
organizatlon anc preparaticon of macerials for
Soward's review,

Telephene conference with Def., Counsel-James
LaRue regarding status of discovery and
information from Stacte Farm.

Telephone conference with Debbile Dunn regarding
payment by State Farm to Dr. Spainhower,
Telephcone conference with Dr. Spainhowsr's
office!Tracy) regarding payment by State Tarn.
Review carrespondences by Del. Counsel regarding
availaple dares for depositions of Hardino and

Plaintiffs.

=

eliver State Farm producec document copiesz o
messenger from Goloolchea's office; deliver
check for copies to accounting

File manzgemernt,

Assembled exhibits for espert witness; attenisd

conference with expert witness Soward; prenarec
deposition outline for continuing deposition of
Marvin Harding:; file management.

Meet with expert Wayne Soward redgarding his

avaluation and ir preparacion for

Harding

g - . P - o— . cw
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deposition of HarzZing; Conference with Richard
Greener regarding billing status anc letter -~

co-CounseC .

Corrigan  03/08/4¢ 5 U .50 2,560 7817  rile Management. COrganized discovery work file
for MNancy J. Hopkins-Garrett.

LT deznoy Jo tophins- 03/38/38 E il 1.50 157.50 7813 Review supplemental productlion ¢l documents o
Def's regarding Mediclaimr materials and
preparation of materials for continuec Oral
depositicon of Marvirn Harding.
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Golicoechea
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Harding; Jletter to CZlaims adiustor regarding
nillang for Dunn;

Q4733790 E I L.00 1G5, G0 7345 Telephens conference with Debpie Duan with

regarding tc setting up her cral deposition anc
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witnesses learned and information learned in

ora: deposition of Marv Harding.

Meet with Debbie Dunn in preparaticn for oral
geposition ;

Tile management. Organized files in
anticipation of depositions of Dunn,
Castellancs and Stirm. Telephons call to Dr.

McKim regarding medical reccrds for Mr.

Castellancs - (208} 4867-575€. Telepncne call
te Canyon County regarding accident report

John

for
Stirm; telephone call to Ada County
regarding accident report for Johr Stirm;

searched files for accident report for John

Mest with Frank Castellancs in preparation for
(2.07;

Telephone conference with Jerry G.

nis oral deposition
regarcing
status of case to include preparaticon for orzl

depositions and fees and costs: Preparatien and

reveiw of files for Dunn, Stirm and Castellanos
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depesitions.
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preparation for her oral deposition by
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Lunn and Jenifer Harvey.
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John Stirm.
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billing and iiens Lor TPlaintiff's, preparation

for tne oral ceposition cf Castellanos.

File management. Organized medicals for Jdon

Zrtirm -- reguested vpdaled billings from
various providers.

Prepare for and meet with client regarding ooa.
ceposition of Franl: Casevallianags.

Medical reguest letters reguesting reports an.l
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INIT. ATTY¥ RHG Richard H. Greener
BILL. ATTY RHG Kicharc H. Greener

RESF. ATTY RHG Ricnarc H. Greener
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pills for Jchn Stirm.

Review Tape from '8¢ Regional Clain Meeving
attend conference with Dr. Cslhoun and D. Dunn
regarding medical status ;Meet with Dunn post
conference with Calhoun; Review discovery
decuments from Def. and draft letter to Def.
in response.

File management,

Review Discovery Answers

Continue to review discovery from Def. anc
drafting of correspendence to Del. regarding
continuec recuests: continue teo draft

Interrogatories and Request for procuctior =

Daf.

File management of defendants' lates: set ot
discovery responses; drafted plaintiffs:
discovery demands to defendants; revisions to
discovary rasponses.

Cont'd te prepare ans tc Def. Interrcgatories
and Reguest for producticen and draft suppl
Interrogatcrises and Request for preduction b
Plaintifi; final correxpondence to Def.
regarding discovery. lssues and scheduling oral
deposition; Supplemental production of mediczl
recoras and bills of Dr. Calhoun tor Debbie
Lunn; letter to Stare Farm with enclosure of
medical records and bills of Dr. Calhour for
Debbie Dunn.

Cont'd to dratt Interrogatories and Reguest [or
production tc Defendants; Cont'd to drafr ani
tinal letter tc Def. Counsel regarding Def.
answers te our outstanding discovery and cral
deposition schedule: Memc tc Richard Greene:
regarding status of matrer.

kedrafted letter to cppasing counsel.
Kedrafted discovery demands and responses,
Worked on discovery responsss.

File management -- indexed pleadings.
Redrafted supplemental discovery responses.
File management. Organized documents [or
presentaticon at depositions of claims
representatives; organized most recent
production o documents from cerendants.
Completed organization of defendants' April
199¢ preoduction of documents; f£lle managemsni:
indexed recent vleadings.

File management.

File management.

File management.

Kequest for preducticn to Defendant: letter to



Fage: B
Matter Leager Report Ruon @ 117117495
From J1/01/80 thru 11/21/9%9
SLTEeT Skaug
HATTER Class Actien INIT. ATTY RH: Richard H. Greener

BILL. ATTY RHG Richard H. Greener

RE3P. ATTY RHG Richarc H. Greener

Defendant in response to correspondence from

Defendant.

m

H. Greene 3/153/8¢ | 1.00 275.00 5034 Review answers to Fifth Bet of Interrcgatorios
and Seventh Document Production Request;

memorandum to file

%)

96 E G 0.40 22.00 g0z File management.
GE g

E L 0.5¢

(35 File management. Indexed pleadings; revised

master index.

Jo Hopitins-  05022/96 B i 0.eC 93.00 d23¢ Telephone conference with Debbie Dunn regardin

0o

S5tate Farm's regquest for Dr. Holt tc examins

Lebnie and Julie Dunn ¥ 2, Letter tc State F

regarding reguest.
DE/22/9¢ a u 1.30 Z36.50 803G Review correspondence from McGarvey regarding
108¢& Divisior Claims Supervisor Conference,
Memo tc the File, Letter to Shaffer X2
regarding thelr previous new position cr ths

avaluation of Julie and Debbie Dunr by Helt.

.00

7. o0

File management.

=
I
i
"

LW
T
w
I
-
=
=
th
It

o
I
28]
L
-
[t}
o 0
L
[l

™
[as)
L
s
L
[l
—
sl
-1
<

Telephone conference with Debbie Dunn regarding
evaluatior of Holt for her and Jullie anc
Defendant's change cof position, file review,
Tinal discovery to Defendants and responses.

b kizrers H. Sreene (053/25/39¢ B u G.aou

b
13y
-

f.50 8080 Review discovery response; memorandum toc Harn

J. Hepkines-Garrett regarding Motion tc Compel;

review L. Dunn Doccument Production Request

O5/728/G6 E o L.eo 105.00 3045 Conterence with Debbie Dunn regarding Def.
Eeguest for production.

[ % kathizern Corcigan 03728798

to
-
[0
Lo
=
[
[=3]

.50 g8046 File maragement.

Haro Jro Hopkine- 05729796 E U [B

o

8048 Letter to Defense counsel regarding oral

ceposition and informaricon: attempted telepn

conferance with Grace Vandenpueval. regardi
oral deposition.

Corsigan QB/30/96

[oi]
[

251 File management.

Hophkins- 05730 /49€

w
[}
-
o
o

94.5C E0S2  Review correspondence from Srate Farm and
letter in response to State Farm regarding
Dunn(Juliie and Depbie); Letter te Defensze

counsel regarding oral depositicons.

n
a

OG04/ 08

m

i 2050 22,50 f05%  Final Ans and Responses to Del. Discovexry
Fegquests.

06704790 jad il .80

83

i.00 3054 Review claim file, medical records and
information received from slient regarding Luann
in preparation for responding to discovery;

Refinal discovery responses.

2C

o
]
|

'
L
[ I -

Kathleer Zorrigan 06/04/5€ = & 0.70 3. File managemant.
2

06/04/5¢ =} 0 C.30 803% Discovery research.
1h14

Jo Hoplins-  08/05/96 B u .80

o
=
&

BOSZ Televhone conference witn Bruce Sguas

regarding oral depositicn of Claims Specizl

and Dist court decision by Judge Eismanii.

Caiiiesr Unrzigar, DedRI/SG E U 0.5

t

8064 File management.

D/ 06/ e B S (.50

3064 le management.

’ - . P — - . - —— . . .
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INIT. ATTY RHG Richard H. Gresner
BILL. ATTY RHG Richard RE. Greener
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01/24/4¢

/2179

[ngd

wal

ul

m m

o

0

u

[

o

o~

b
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L3C 16.50
.50 1537.5C
.50 27.50
5k 27.58C
.0C 10E.00
.30 16,50
30 16,50
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40 22,00
30 16.50
2 27.50
50 15%.50
SG 2250
To 87.50
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[ B )
[ %]

8083

8086

8087

8085
3:01
8138k
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[

Telephone conference with Grace VandenBueval
regarding status of matter and avallability feor
cral deposition; Letter to Def. Counse.
regarding availlapls date for VandenHueval.
Pleading windexing.

Indexed pieadings; file organization.

Review Summary Juddgment cecisien in Harris
case; Conference with Richard Greener and

Giocechez regarding summary judgement decisi

in Harris's pad faith case.
File organization:; searched file and located
names of Washinagten attorneys: memc to Nanawy .

Hopkins-Garrett regarding Washington attornevs.

File organirzation; fax» to James Arnold in
Lewiston regarding Washington attorneys
involved in bad faith suits,

Conference with Richard Greener regarding
status of matter and suspending the scheduling
of oral depositions until Richard Greener can
evaluate the legal status of the case;
Telephone conference with Jim LaRue regarding
suspending the cral depositions.

File organization -- indexec pileadings.

File organlization.

Telephone conference with Grace VandenHueval
regarding deposition; Telephone conference with
Jim LaRue regsarding VandenHusval deposition.
ORGANIZED file.

FILE c¢rganization.

ORGANIZED file; updated master inde:.

Review correspendence from State Farm regarding

Dunn and Rittenhcuse; Letfer in response to

Dunn;:Cenference with Jack Giording regarding
case and response letter to State Farm
regarding Rittenhouse; Letter uc State Farm
regarding Rittenhouse.

Review communicaticn witn Dr. West regardi

pad faith claims against 5t. Farm;, Memc to
file.

Review correspondence; reseavch; conference
with Nancy J. Hookins-Garrett.

Conferernce Jacl GJlording regarding status of
matter; Drait letter to attorrevs in Utan
regarding recent verdict and potential to
discuss cases and get testimony o evidencs
used in thelr trial;, Letrer to Expert Sword
regarding above.

Telephone confsrence witn RKuss Dunn regarding

Debbie arnd status o matrer; Memo to I:xle

[



<, Hamphre,, Greener & Welsh, F.A. Fage: 1
Matter Ledger Report Bun @ 11/11/0%
From 01/01/80 tnru 11/117%9

INIT. ATTY RHG Richard K. Greener
BILL. ATTY RHG Richard E. Greener

RESP. ATTY RHG Richard E. Greener

regarding.
03/04/9¢ B U 1.04 10%z.00 8310 Meet with Ritenhouse regarding status oI mat
and te discuss the elements and final
settlement of tne underlying action against the
tert feascr.
a49712/96 E

[}
!

(]
Lt
[ oul
=
[
fan]
Ll
[+5)
wr
[
o

Conference withh Jack Gicrding and Richard
Greener regarding status of matter, Rittenhouse
release, and Utah case; re-draft Rittenhouse

release.
0S/18/96

[$2]
=
Iy

.50 28Z.50 8330 Telepnene conference with Rich Humphries
regarding Logan Ut. case won against St. Farm;
Draft of Reguest for preduction and
Interrcgatories te St. Farm:; Memo to file and
to team regarding above.
10/0L/3€ E U L.00 105.00 4360 Telephone conference with Wayne Soward
regarding status of matter; File review
regarding discovery cut-offs; Telephone
conference with c¢lerk for Judge Mewhouse
regarding pre-trial oraer.
10/01/90 =} u .40 22.0C 8361 File management.

13/01/96 B u 1.28 128.0C 8362 Review letter from 3t. Farm regarding Dunn and
Helt's opinion: Letter to client regarding
above; Letter client regarding above; Letter o
cxpert Soward regquasting depositions in eother

cases of the claim specialists in this case.

1003796 E 0 .6 3%.00 81365 Conference with Nancy J. Hopkins-Garrett;
telephone conversation with Judge Newhouse's
clerl revarding scheauling order; drafted
moticr for scheduling order.

U= Nancy J¢ Hopkins-  10/04/7%6 B U C.an0 4200 2370 Prepare Motion te Vacate Trial Setiting and for

Pre-trial Sceduling Conferenc

10723796 E Review letters from St. Farm in Dunn and

L]
o
=]
[
e
[
[l
]
=]
)
o
-

Rittenhouse; Memc to file regarding arpitration
rrovisior 1n Dunr &nd release in Rittenhouso.
13/21/79¢8

tn
[

G4l 22.00 #3805 File organization.

10/22/9¢ E u .20 210.040 §3%7 Review Discovery and Motion to Vacate: memo rv

LI Mancy Joobmenizdine- 1024 /8¢

2

Telephone conference with Dr. Calhoun regarding

m
=
=

.GU 0%,

<
s
o
w
pia
[

Dunn; Lertey to 5t. Farm regarding bunn;
Telepheone conference with Rittenhouse regarding
Dr. Deaa; Letter te 3t. Parm regarding
Rittenhouse; Conference with Richard Greener
regarding case.

L. freene

[t}
[
w
o
T3
%]

K]

.50 849¢ Prepare for and attend Motion teo Vacate

SN erding T1/21/06 <1 U .

o
o
I
o

LY 8464 TReview correspondence; conference with Nancy J.

Hopkins-Garrett,

.

-

[
-

4447 Telephone conterence with J. Goicoeches

m
L
o
o

n

8310 Conference with C. Kronbarg

I [RETTRATINN s

w
o
Ll
I
]

Fina! responses ta Reguest for proouction;

Letter teo State Farm with enclosures and to



Humplirey, Creener & Welsh, F.AE. Page: 11
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Trom 01/01/280 thro 11712798

Jadgf Eruce B. Skaug

State Farm Zlass Action INIT., ATTY RHG Richard H. Greener
BILL. ATTY RHG Richard H. Greener

RESF. ATTY RHG Richard H. Greener

Defense Counsel.

EFE.< Ficnard K. Greene 137/20/96 B u .40 70,00 8342 Telepnone conference with 7. LaRue; memo 1o
file
Qi/11797 B il .40 7c.0C 9637 Review letter from J. LaRue; memerandum to Il

Hopklns-Garrett

WTH Haro, Jo Hophins- o 01/27/97

to

u .60 63.00 3650 Teliephone conference with Dr. Calhoun regarding
the mental status and stability of Debbie Dunn
to undergo further deposition testimony:
Attempted telephone conference with Debbie,
left message.

Q1725797 B = 0.6C 63.00 B653 Telephone conference with Debbie Dunn regarding
evaluation by Dr. Calhcur regarding akility o
continue cral depositicon: Review correspondence
from State Parm regarding continued medical
care of Debbie Dunn with response fc tne sams.

Q2714797 E u o.50 92,50 8708 Telephone conference with Debble Dunn regarding

status of cases and ner medical status.

az/2

U
(]
m

u .56 52,

W
[}
[=3]

757 FReview report of Dr. Calhcoun regarding Dunn and
ability to undergce deposition; Letter to Larae

regarding above.

FE. Carsaon 0z/27/87 E U 0.75 48.75

o
[==]
~1
-
(%]

Organize file; update pleading board and index

pleadings; bring file current.

B Mangy Jo Hophins- o 02/27/97 B U 0.50 52.50 8774 Telephone conference with opposing ccunsel
regarding deposition schedule, trial scheduls,
and settlement document for Rittenhouse.

02/28/9% E Il 0. 3C 3L.5C 8775 Letter to opposing counsel recarding depositicn

of VanDenHouvel.

ol
[
.
[

3767 B U .60 ©3.00 8780 Telephone conference with opposing counse.l
regarding issues to doc with uproming
depositions of Castellanos and Vanden Heuvel.

03/05797 B U

=

.30 18%.00 8791 Letter to LaRue regarding Vanden Heuvel
deposition, File review regarding Castellanos
and Defendant Request for production;
investigation and file review regarding Bliue
Cross reimpursement; Conference with Richard

GCreener regarding status of matter.

-

Q3/07 /97 =} 0 u. 80 24,00

2
w
o

=]

Raview thne medical records and 1nformation tnat
nas been produced regarding Frank Castellancs.
Q2710757 E Al Lok EZOEL Red4  Telephons conference with Jim LaRue regardin:

depesiticr. of Castellangs; File review
regarding gproductlion of documents.

3¢ iathiegr, Ccerrigan 03/12/97 B J .30 16.50 2312 Retrieved and photocopied deposition of John
Stirm.

NJH  Manew Jo Hopkins- 03712757 B u .50 472,50 B8l4 Prepare ifcr and meet with Trank Castellanos 1in

preparation for his deposition; Draft and

final Request for production to Defendants

regarding ser:lement documents ol Cassteiianrcs

and Rizrenhouse; Prepare chronciogy for use

with Castellanos in continved preparation for

nis depositicn.
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INIT. ATTY REG Richard H. Greener

8ILL. ATTY RHC
RESP. ATTY RHG
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Richarc k. Greener
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Conference with Nancy J. Hopkins-Garrett.
Prepare for anc detend the deposition of Frant
Casstellanes: Telephone conference with John
keenan regarding above and action collection:
letter to John Keenan regarding above with capy
of action ccllectieon netice.

Letter t¢ 3tate Farm regarding stipulazien for
scheduling,

Letter to Kenan regarding collection action of
Dr. McKim against Castellanos: Letter to
Castellanos regarding deposition review and
chnanges.

Prepare supplemental response to raquest for
production, nctice of service, letter to
adiuster

Telephone conference with opposing counse:
regarding deposzition date for Dunrn, tria:i
scheduling stipulaticn, and available dates -o
depose the Srate Farm adijustors; memo to
Ricnard Greener regarding above.

Conference with Richard Greener.

Meet with Grace VanDenHueval in oreparstion tfor
her depositicn; Review informaticon croduced co
defendants,

Prepare for and defend the deposition of Gracs
Vanden Heuwval.

Review correspondence from Defendants regardirg
trial date and deposition schedule; draft
moticn for trial setting; letter te defendars's
counsel regarding ceposition date for Dunr.
Review files: review e-mall from Wancy Hopkins:
research files for memos, case research, copy
relevant documents

kReview and finalize Jetter with revisions.

MEET WITH DEBBY DUNN IW PREPARATIOM FOR HEE
Ceposition; File review iv preparation for Lunn
deposition; Defend deposition of Dunrn.
Conference witn M. Hopkins-Garrett

Conference with J. Harris; mems to file

~
1t}
3
Q
—
s}
5
=
-
1
-
[
1=}
u
s

ding starus ol matter; levzer
tc Deiense counsel regarding available garecs

for deposition of claimg specialists and

Review file: conversatior with Nangy Hopkins
regarding letter and package sent to Bryan
Farney; confirm informaticn; fax copy of letrar
to Brvan Farney; make nctation of address and
advise Tammy.

File review anc maintenance.

Tile reorganizatiocrn.
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Page:
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Richard #. Greener

Richard M. Greener
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Undated and revisec pleading indes.

Began preparation of client files in
anticipaticn of agent's depositions
Cenference with paralegal in preparation for
file crganization for exhibits and upcomming
depesition of claims representatives.

File maintenance and reorganization,

Draft and Final supplemental discovery
responses te Defendant; letter te VandenHueval

regarding cutstanding discovery issues; memc to
Iile regarding Dunn and depocsiticon changes.
Conference with Richard Greener regarding
status of matter and begin to prepare and
resend information to Farney.

Conversation with Nancy Hepkins regarding c

begin researching file regarding doouments ©

be resent to Bryan Farney
Research cemputer log feor May leéth letter o

Bryan Farney; research file and complile another

package of information for forwarding tce Bryan

Farney; go through all pleading £iles; reseacch

files:; memcrandums and decisions: copy all

pertinent documents; prepare transmittal letcer

e Bryan Farney; prepare United Parcel

overnight delivery:; forward ail gocuments.

Letter with enclesures resernt o Bryan

Farney; Ahttempted telephone conference with
Defense Counsel.
Letter tc Dr.

Hagarn, Dr. Frantz anc Scutn

Dakota Department cof Labor regarding Grac

[+

Vanbsrn Hewaval.
File organizaticn and malntenance.

Continued organizing client files for upcoming
depositions.
Reorganized file; photocopied and assembled
auzsuments for clients’ files.

Continued photocopying and assemblincg of cliant
files.

Continued photocopving and organization of
client materiails

for agents' depositions;

telephone call te opprosing counsel's office
regarding possible dates for agents’
depositions; conference with Nancy J,
Hopkins-Garretc.

Telephone call from Jim Lakue's secretary
regarding deposition dates.

Letrter to J.

Lakue regarding deposi

Compieted preparation of client materiais fo.

zgent's depcsiticns; telephnonse cal. to Jim

LaRue's office regarding deposition gates.
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Matter Ledger Kepor:t Run

From 01/01/80 thru 11/11/95

INIT. ATTY RHEZ Richard H. Greener
BILL. ATTY RHG Richard H. Greener
RESP. ATTY RHG Richard H., Greener

07/14/97 E U 2.00 165.00 8537 Photocopied, assembled anc organized Linda
Bittenhouse materials ir anticipation of

agents' depositions.

i Jo Bopkins- 07510497 E J 4.0C 420.0C 9560 Meet with client to review deposition
transcript for pessible changes.
i Zorrigar 07/:10/87 E i 1.00 5L.0¢C 9567 Telephone call to Jim LaRue's secretary
regarding deposition dates; méme to Richard
Greener; file organization: completed
Rittenhecuse Jile.
07/16/97 2} & G40 2z, 00 9565 Memos regarding depesiticn schedule.
Wi Kancy Jo Hopkins-  07730/97 5 u 0.5¢C 52,50 9720 Rewview letter for Defense Counsel regarding
Grace Vanden Heuvel pertaining to tne 5. Dalata
Dept of Labor; Letter in response; Letter tco
Vanden Heuvel regarding.
[ Kathleern Corrigan 08/07/97 B C C.40 22.00 9756 File maintenance and crganization.
08/07/97 B U ;.70 35.50 973% Reviewed deposition of Debbie Dunn.
05/27757 B U C.30 16,50 986% Telephone call to Grace Vanden Heuvel regarding
ITT Hartford release of information.
09/52/97 B U 0.56 27.50 8484 Researched Vanden Heuvel £ile.
1iil Mancy Jo Hepkins-  09/24/97 B u .06 105,00 10042 Review information from a State Farm case from
California.
10/08/737 B u C.30 31.50 1017¢ Letter to LaRue regarding stipulaticn to extend
discovery cut-off.
10/.7/57 & r 0.30 31.5G i029% Letter to Grace VanDenHeuval regarding State
Farm Coverage and Chircpractor continued
billing.
: Latnleen Corrigan 13/22/97 B u G.50 27 .5C 10353 rile maintenance and crganization.
11/0373% B = C.o0 32,00 10227 File review: drafted Nintn Keguests for
Proguctior to defendants.
135 Hancy Jo dephkins-  11/03/97 B L .50 2,50 10531 Conference with Richard Creesnsr regarding
status of case; Final keguest fcr proguction to
Defendant.
AR Richard H., Creesre 11/03/927 g u G.e0 105,00 1073  Conference with Nancy Hepkins; draft meme to
file.
| Hathleer Zorzigan  11/04/9% E U 0.4k 22,00 10535 Revised Ninth Reguest for Production tco
defengants.
it MEnee U Hogpnins- o 11704797 =} 8 G.a0 53.00 10557 Review correspondence regarding fee agreemsnt
tatnleer Sorrigan 117075975 =} I G.40 20,40 10588 Fille maintenance and pleading indering.
B = 0,40 22,00 1085 Telepnone call from coppesing counsel's
secretary regarding depesition datesz; memc oo
interested parties.
H. Greene 1Z2/01757 5 U .50 87.50 10905 keview Response toe Document Production Reguest:
draft memo tc file.
R Sraven b rloe 127027497 E U 13z 146, 3¢ 1048% Meeting with Richard CGresner regarding
Lepositions of Kay Fasen; Shawn Egan; Heathe:s
Carter and Scott West; telapnone conierencs
with James LaRue regarding scheduling; review
file,
b Hicharo H. Sreene  1X/032/97 E L [EIT aTLeG 10832 Telephone conference with J. LaRue; conferernu



Humpnrey, Greener & Welsh, T.A. rage:

er lLedger Repor: Rurn : 11/11749%
Trom 01/01/80 thru 11/11/99

INIT. ATTY RHG FRichard H. Greener
BILL. ATTY RHG Richard H., Greener
REST. ATTY RHG Richard H. Sreener

with &. Price.

i Taralun K

fu
—
-l
b
o
i
1o
i
o
(o)
=

Conference with Richard Greener and Steven
Price regarding depositions ol adjusters;
conferences with K.Corrigan and J.Mertz
regarding scheduling and noticing cof adjuster
depositions; draft memo tc Steven Price;
calendar depcsitions per advice from opposing
counsel

IBF Igzwven Z, Price Li/o3san E o .33 3¢.30 10942 Telephone conference with cpposing counsel

regarding deposition schedule.
THE

M. Baldin 1Z/04/97 B 0 1.3¢ 71.50 $103% Conference with Steven Price regarding
preparation oI materials for adjuster
depositions; review deposition files and
exhibits with organization of materials for day
Eascr deposition: conferences with K.Corrigan

and Steven Price
ZBF Steven k. Price 12/09/97 B u £.4

1~
-3
(=)
€T
(39
o

11051 Prepare for deposition of Kay Zason; review
depesition of Mike Taylor and Harding; review

Hernandez file.

Crzens 5] T [ R V22,50 1098¢ 0Office conference with Steve Price {3)
Brize 2 ti 7.5 233,80 11050 FPrepare for Deposition of Kay Eascon; attend
depositionr of Kay Easorn.

NI Nercy Jo Hopkins~  1%2/19/97 E T 11145 EReview memc from Baldino regarding Shaw: HReview
far from Dr. West; Review case law regarding
State Farm Irom Taylor

ThE o Zarolyn M. zaldin GZ2F05/9F B i) 0,20 11,00 1866801 LITIGATION Telephone call to J.Harris' office
re: expert witness infermation with memo to
R.Greener and N.Hopkins

MR Bancy o Hopsinm- 02733795 B L .50 Telephcne cal: to potential super: Steve
Prater(.2}); Memo tvo file recarding depositions
cf adjustorsi.3).

02/19/9¢ E L o.0G 210.00 1945274  File review; Conference with Steve Price rs

discovery lissues, depositions, meticons; Meme Lo
legal team regarding status cf cass and
projected tasks and complietion dates;
Conference with Mellssz Wolfe regarding statas
of matter and task oI review for Motion to
Compe X .

Mzlissa Woliz G2/23/96 B & 1.5C #2.50 197511 Review and analyze discavery fron opposing
counsel; prepare 1ist ol objected qusestions

R Y Greenc 02/23/9C E i r.&r 10%. 00 203059 Confersnce with Mancy Hopring regarding Pracay
expert witness.

L Maprv de Ropkias- D3/06/98 B 9] .00 10775 kKeview letter received for Flaint s attorne,
and jury list sent over Irom Jim Harris
regarding nis bad faith case.

03/10/79¢6 E Li 4.0c 21%7464  Review and organize Discovary from opposing
counsel; memc to Mrs. Hopkins reagarding
Defendant's cobjection toc Discovery
MR Marsy Jo Hophins-  D3S1109% 5] o - 105,400 217097  Review memorandum [rom parslegal; review court

proceedings in Jim Hazris's bad faith case.



qumonres, Lresener & Welsh, DMA Page: 16
Matter Ledger Report Run @ 11/1./9G
From 01/01/30 thrr 11/11/89
T Eruce B. Skaoc
Goo rare Farm Ciass Rction INIT. ATTY RHG Richard ¥. Greener

BILL. ATTY RHG Richara E. Gresner

RESP. ATTY RHG Richara K. Greener

w
-
—
L]
]
@
n

.oc 229775 Draft and final letter to Defencants regard
outstanding discovery and moZion To compel.

MWW Mslissz Wolfs 03/18/492 b 1 .o 65,00 238034 oDraft letter tc Lakue regarding discovery: msmc

to Nancy J. Hepkins

WY dancy Jo Hoprins- o 03/1%/8% B u 2.80 294.00 237151 Review Intercgatcries propounded by Plaintifl

Draft Intercgatories to Defendant; Prepars

expert disclesure for Prater; Conierence with

paralegal regarding Harris' trial vs. Btate

Farm.

Tamelz F. Zazrson J03/19/8¢8 E U C.ac Ze. 00 237537 Foliow up on Robinson v, State Farm; meeting
with Wancy Hopkins; prepare e-mail memorandun
te update handling attorneys regarding status

of Plaintiff's case ir Rcobinson.

Hancy Jo Hepkins-  CR/20/9¢& B G 2,00 21G.0cC 233049 Review Julie Shaw file witn memo to Rhg; Final
Interogatories and file.

TEZ Tami Christensen 03/24/58 B G 0.70 3%.0G 24349g CASE ADMINISTRATIOM Review request from Jim

Harris; Review clients' policies and

underwriting files; t/c with Loulse at Jim

Harris' coffice

il

Famela . Carson 03730798 B 0 0,70 45,50 245074 Telepheme call te Jim Herris' office to
followup with status of trial; update Nancy

Hopklns regarding status.

T Hophins~ 03730792 E il 3,00 31%.00 247314 Attend and cbserve trial of Jim Haerris versus

State Farm.
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-

3. 50 245208 Fellow up with Jim Harris' office regarding
witnesses and closing arguments in Robinson v,
State Farm.

IIGH Har Jc Hepkins- 03/31/98 3 u 7.00 T3z.0C 244432 Attend and observe trial of Jim Harris versus

State Farm; Review case law on bad faith claim.
0401788

2

U 1.30 136.50 24916l Continue to review pleadings; Memo to Richard
Gresner.

Qa/027983 E Al &.0C HaQ, oo 2449441 Telepnone call with Steve Prater; Review all
Flaintiff'=s answers and responses to Defendants
discovery and suppiementz; Telepnone call with
Bruce Skaug and Jerry G; Letter to clients:
Letter to Jim Harris; Memo to file regarding
sStrategy.

04/03/9¢0 E u 4. 30 452,50 249887 Telephone call with Wayne Sowarc, experz;

Telephone call with Dunn and Ritenhouse:

Frepare releases for update of medical recorasz

and information ¢ medical records; Continue to

revise supplementation of interrcogatories;

Continue to review and supplement discovery

respenses; Memo te file anc RHG.

LIlarn ML Greens J4/03/798
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Conference w/lancy Jo Hopkins: memorandom To
the fiie re acticr to be taken.

04/04 /98
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Review MNancy Garrett memorandum; memorandunr o
lancy .

HJi Marcy Jo Hopkins-  04/006/96 B

o
[
1
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o

¥ile organizaticon; Telephone call with John

Stirm regarding status ¢f matter; Telepnone



Cosng, Humphrey, Greener & Welsh, PLA. Page: 1%

Matter Ledger Repor: Run : 11/11/9%
From 01/01/80 thru 11/11/9%

E. Skaug

Parn. Clasz Acvion INIT. ATTY RHG Richard H. Greener
BILL. ATTY RHG Richard k. Greener
RESF. ATTY RHG Richard LK. Greener

i

call with Grace Vanden Huvel regarding statu
of matter; memo to file regarding depositions
of ciaim specialists; Begin legal review and
research regarding Motion to Certifyv as Class,
2470798 B u
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]
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Revise discovery responses; Final discovery
responses; letters to client regarding
outstanding discovery and Harris trial verdico.
SRt Zack S Giorzding 04/07/7538 B u 0,40 56.00 26231. Conference with Nancy Garretz.

10k Nancoy Jo Hopkins-  04/054/0E E 3} 3.0¢ 312.06 26019Y% Revise and re-final sutpplemental discovery
responses; Review recent opinions on Bad Faizh
Litigatiecrn; Meme te fLile and DGlynh regarding

outstanding legal reseacn issue.
PEC  Famsla R. Carson 04/10/98

Lae}
Lo
[

.3C

=
o
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26184¢ Review memorandum from Nancy Hopkins; telephong
call tc Harris' office tc inguire as teo
obtaining information relating to witness and

exhibit lists and jury instructions.

Jo Hoplins-  04/10/95 B

S
o
)

420.00 281854 Draft Interrogatcecries tc¢ Defendant regarding
scope of similar cases; Draft Moticn and
Memorandum in support of Class Certificatiron;
Memc to file regarding witnesses, eunibics in
Yarris case; Conference with paralegal
regarciing above; Conference with J5G regarding
status of matter and issues in underlying

actions with tort feasors.

&
[

5.oGicerding Ja/13/9% L.80 10G. 00 262313 Conference with Nancy Garrett.
g €22

1
u 2.50 262,50 2 3% Memo to Rhgy Conference with RHG and J3Gy

e
o

Joo Hopkine-  D4/1357

Letter teo LaRue regarding deposltlons.

Ghiording 01713798 E U LLAC

26233 Conferenceg with Richard Greener and Nancy

Garrett.

Jo Hophking-  04/15/6G9

i
o
[
[}
Pl
[
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.50 263924 Telepnone call with Jim Harris offics;
Freparation Tor meeting with Skaug and
Goicoecnea; Mee:. with SGreener, Sjordin, Shaug,

and Goicocechea.

i TR Pamele fL Carson 04715795 B ° G40

3%}
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<
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t
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o
[

Teiephone conversation with Harris' offics
regarding statuz of information requested by
them regarding State Farm v. Rebinson; updats

i Nancy Hopikins witn status; meering witn Carolyrn
Baldinc regarding status of file and case

management.

i, Greene (04/15/98 E L w30 4

s
I
e

268544 Conferrence w/Cl. <olcoecnea and B. Shkaug;
conference w/Nancy Jo Hophinge and Jach

Glordinag.
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200,00 269640

o

Conference with Dich Gresner; conference with
Dick Greener, Jerry Geoigechea, Bruace Skaug and

Nancy Garrett.

[{}

JdEN Many Je diepkins- G4

U .BO 189, G 266337 Review and revise deposition netices for Egan
and Carter:; Conference with RHG regard:inc
status of malter; Review correspondence fron

Roger Hrown regarding potent.al new Plaintii

and conference with RHEG pertaining to letter.




., Humphrey, Greener & Welsh,
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Page: lec

Matter Ledger Report Rur: @ 11/11/9G
from 01/01/80C thre 11/11/99

INIT. ATTY RHG Richard H. Greener
BILL. ATTY RHG Richard H. Greener

RESF. ATTY RBG Richard k. Greener

04.,/22/9E B 0 1.50 157.50 269784 Conference with Jon Simmons regarding researzh
on class action: Conference with J5G on class
zctlon; Telephone call with Roger Browrn

regarding potentla: new cases.
04/22/58 E U .50

1
fas
-1

7,50 270398 Conference with Wayne Soward: Telephone
conference with Barbara Glenn; Memc to flle and
team; Review material received from Mr. Soward:
Review material from Jim Harris, specifically
the testimony of Jim Mathis; Telsephone call o
potential expert Norme Meilscon, Univerity of
Calgary.

JET Jacoih 5. Siording 04/22/98 J= C .50

FRT Pameiz R, Carseon 047237082 E ¢] 0.40

(=l
ay
e8]

.50 27228% Conference with Narncy Garret:.

~
oy

.Qu 270346 Telephone rhone conversation with Jim Harris'
office regarding status of requested
information: nave courier pick up information:
review information and provide tc handling

attorney.
aR Jerr Bimeony 04/33/92

an
wsl
-

B L 0,80 72,00 271438 Research re: potential conseguences of failing

to certify class.

Jo Hoplins- 04/24/09% B o 7.0 735,00 274472 Review testimony of Jim Mathis and Steve Prater
in Jim Harris case; Telephone call with Norms
Nellson regarding review of matter, she has

already reviewed for Jim LaRue and State Farm.
| 335 Jacwe £. Giording 04/24/9z2 B L

a
[R)
=3
)
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e

oc 275732 Review trial testimeony of Prater and Mathis.
J5 Jor Stumens 24724496 B G 1.90 i71i.00 283624 Research re: risks of class certification;
conference with Nancy re: the same.
0d/24/9% E £ 130 127,00 28362¢ Finallize research § construct analysis re:
risks of class certification.
Qa/26/98 B u 0,20 15.00 283644 Draft Memorandum to Mancy re: risks of class
ertificarcion.

c
E Ll 0,80 G:.00 275328 Conference with paralegal regarding oreparatiorn

of outlines of testimony of PFrater and Math:is
in the Robinson case; Memc to file remarding
ahove; Review research memc on the issue i
class certificazion; Memo to file regarding D,

NGrma Neilssn.
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Review Simmens memo; conference with NJH.
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braf:z/revise memoranduam to Nanrsy re: the same.

] U 1.60 ZBL.GT 292032 Review memorandum regerding experts: work on
. strategy.

o tzhbie Thompson 04/28/98 E i ILED 3,50 LITIGATION Review Robinseon tria.l Lranscript.

e
oo
;oo
A
I
i

i Danizl L. Slyon 04729/9¢6 B u .20 G.00 253464  Research regarding walver of arbitration

1

Cianse.

[ T'ebliaie Thompson
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284266 LITIGATION Review Robinson trial transcriplbz.

JaT 0 Jeos L. Ghoording 24./307598 279130 Review correspondence.

T
—
o

CL%  Laniss L. SZLlynn 04./30/9¢4 O £3.00 28348: Research regarding waiver of arbirration.

L ey Jo Bephans- o 056/01/86

m
—
[}
o
o2

283481 Conference with Diclk Greener; Letter to Bruce

Skaug regarding cost/fes splic,

Dol i= Thompaor G0

to
s

26827F  LITIGATION Preparation of partial summary of




Tosss, homphrey, Greener & Welsh, FUA. Page: 1
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Matter Ledger Rreport Ran : 11/11/9%

Frem 01/01/8C thru 11/11/99

E. Skauag

0% Zrate Farm Class Rction INIT. ATTY RHG Richerd H. Greensr
BILL. ATTY RHG Richarc H. Greensar
RES?, ATTY RHG Richardg H. Greensr

Robinson trial transcrip:.
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Telepnhone call with the family of John Stirm;
Telephane call with potentia. expert Michael

Murray regarding review cof matter.

ZES Ricrard H. Greene  05/03/9% b o G.el loZ.ac 293453 Review response to Plaintiff's 7th Set of
Interrogatories; conference w/N. Hopkins.
I Hophking-  03/08/9% B v 1.¢0 105.00 28E199 Meet with the family of decedeant, Mr. Stirm.
057.2/9: E i 0.50 52.5¢0 289937 Letter to the Glens regarding possikle
testimony.
05/713/9¢% E il 0.50 52.5¢C 292663 Review correspondence {rom Defendant:
Conference with Ricnard Greener.
05/14/98 B v 2.a¢ 210,06 294685 tile review regarding upcoming depositicns of
Carter and Eagan.
05/15/98 B U C.5C 52.50 294686 Continue to prepare information for deposition
of claims adjustors.
EHE RIzhared H. Greene 05/17/98 B U C.3C 52.50 306972 Telephone conference w/J. Gjiording re
depositions.
Giording 05/15/92 =3 u .80 362.50 300253 Conference with Nancy Hopkins-Garrett and Dicr
Gregener; preparation for deposition of 3tate
Farm acdjusters.
oAy 05/19/90 B [§ TS 157.5C 296568 Prepare documents for Jack Siording to review
in preparaticn for the depesitions of Carter
and Egan; Conference witnh GJlording regarding
above.
Jso 0 Jach £ Ghicrding 03/19/98 E U .80 475.0C 3008934 Rewiew correspondence and documents oroduced by
defendants in preparation for depositicns of
Carter and Egan.
0D5/20/58 E il 210 387.50 300%¢4 Review S8tate Farm documents and prepars for
cdepositions of Carter and Egarn.
Heror Je Hepkins- B u ~.aa 195,00 248250 Conference with Jack Gjeordin regarding
deposition of Carter and Egan.
[ 0521788 B U 5.50 2,062 50 292362 Prepare for and attend deposition of Heather
Carter; conference with Jim LaRue.
05/22/9¢ s U .20 £50.00 299673 Prepare for and attend depcsizticn of Shawn
Egan; conference with Jim LaRue; preparatiorn of
discovery regquests.
B 13 1.20 150,00 30104¢ EReview State frarm documents.
i Jc B ! L. 60 leg, 0 301310 File review regarding discovery and motion for
class; Conference with Jacl GJording: Dratt and
Final interrcgatories and Reguests for
Production.
T Laniz. L. Glynon 0L/ 2w/ G = v 5.7¢ 386,50 312908  Research regerding class ac against
insurance companies.
WIi Manoy Jo Hoprips- 05/728/3¢ B u =.00 230,00 304685 kReview case regarding Punitive Damage Award i
9th Circuit, Ace v. RETNA: Review draf: of
Motion to Certify Class.
LLE Damis=l L. Slynn 0e/29/98 E 1 .20 44%.00 312957 Reaview, revise and supplement <lass action
memorandum ir support ol motilon.
BT Daey 050179 B U 1,50 15%.50 30L21& Revise Brio? in Support of Motion to Certify

Class.



Cesnge, Hompnrey, Gresner & Welsh, PLA. Page: 20
Matter lLedger Report Run @ 11/11/%9%

From 01/03/8C tnru 11,/11/9%

N0 Bvate FParm Tlass Action INIT. ATTY RHG Richard E. Greener
BILL. ATTY RHG Richard H. Greener
RESP. ATTY RHG Richard H. Greener

Glording 06/01/95 B U C.60 5.00

329744  Conference with Mancy Hopkins-Garrett.
06/04/79% B U E] 52.50 314

675  Review correspondence and letter to Geoicoechse

regarding Tom Young.

O0c/08/9¢ E
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Review information from Dich Greener: telephoane
call tc Jean Magladry regarding Mathis'
position; prepars memorancurm to Nancy Hopkins

and Dick Greener regarding status.

Carolyn M. Baldin 0&/0B/98 E i [ 5.50 316442 Ceonference with L.Thompson re: case assignment

and worklcad

ilJ8  Mancy Jo Hop

3

06/10/9%2

)
[l

1.5C 157.50C 316754 Telephene call with Mike Mgore regarding
minor's compromise in Dunn matter; Review the
sliy opinlor in Lucas v. Stste Parm and routs
to Dick and Jack with meme to file; Review
Miner's Compromise Fetitien and telephone call
tce client regarding disclosing petition to

annulty company at the reguest of Mike Moore.
yRU Famels k. {arson Q&6/10/36

Al
=
on

el 325.0C 318872 Review and analyze pleading file; review
pleadings on first three pleading boards andg
prepare full pleading index for first three
boards.

06/11/98 B U .80 377,00 318917 Case and file crganization and mansgement;

begin making coples of exhibits on all

depositicons and deposition transcripts for

binder.

Toompson ITTRN A 1 E U 200 130.00 320754 LITIGATION Conference with Par; docket

depesitior exhibits.

F.. Carscn De/12/98 = o L.80 312.0C 320700 Work on f£ile crganization ang transfzr: copy
exhibits of depositions for working copy
notebook: copy condensed depositions for
working copy; reguest medical recoxds on Linda

Rittenhicuse and updated records on Debbie In

Thonpson Qe/lz/98 E [l 3.70 240 .50 322693 LI1TIGATION Docket deposition sxhibits.

L. Larson
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9 Prepare cople:s of discovery responses recels

for handling atternay.

m
[d

ElN 1550 321763 Keview memorandum from Nancy; telephone call <o

Jim LaRue's office to followup on deposition of

Jcott West.

Jo Hepking=-  06/15/76% B G 3.C0 315.00 321623 Memo to paralegals regarding issaes in the zase
Lo be completed regarding depositons and
testimeny cutlines; Review new case law
regarding pac {aith and discovery issues;
Review material recsived from Soward regardin:
ciaims manuel.

Cniiis TAsSHpan Oip/lm/398

L

Rt 16%.0C0 322704 LITIGATICH Freparation of partial ocutlines of
tria. testimeony of Mathis i1in Robinsor v, State
Farm case.

Barrela F. Zarsaorn 00/1e/9¢ B G
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o
e}
o
n
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Telephone call to Jim Lakue's office to inculire
as to status of adates for Scott West's

deposition.
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Lebbie Thompson 06/16/98 B
Famzla ®. Zarson 06/17/98 B
Laptie Thompscn Go/L7 798 =1
05/18/9% B

Jacl 5. Gjording 06/18/98 B
Famesls R. Larsor 06722798 B
¢ Hookins-  06/22/9% B

L. Carson De/23738 E

D&/ 24/98 B

Lebbis Thompson 06/26/98 B
& CAYS0n G6/28/54 E
Lanie’ L. Siyng 06/2%/9% E
) THOMpson 0g/28/9¢8 =
DG/ 09/ 9% B

Famsla |5 De/ 3098 B
Lanzal L. Glynrn Q630708 E
Depnie Thempsor 0o/30/9¢% E
Jo Heohinm-  (07/01/95 B
Famela [, Carseon 0F/01/3% E

Matter Ledger

From 01/03/80 tnru 11/11/9%

Page: ZC
Eun 11713799
INIT. ATTY RHZ Richard H. Greener
BILL. ATTY RHGC Richarc H., Greener
RESF. ATTY RHG Richarc H. Greener
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3230092

326671

328650

3346
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334391
334435

234622

LITIGATION Complete summary of Mathis trizal
testimony in Robinson v. S5.F. trial; conference
with Nancy.

Telephone conversation with Jim LaRue regarding
deposition of Scott West; update handling
attorney regarding defendant's position.
LITIGATION Review trial testimony of Prater,
Patterson, Glenn, and Feldman 1n Robinson cass.
ITIGATICH Preparation of Summary of Trial
Transcript of Stephen Prater.
Review memos and case reports; conference with
Nancy Garrett.

Review medical records received on Linda
Rittenhouse and Debbie Dunn: forward to
handling attorney for review.

Review supplemental medical records received on
Dunn and Rittenhouse.

Work on file; review all discovery reguests and
responsss; recrganize all files faor discovery
and responses and prepare new labels; bagir
preparing new file index; file management:
update anc pring currant all correspondence and
pleadings files; update and prepare additional
witness/deposition files; update pleading
aocket; review additional medical records
received on plaintifi.

Work on file; continuation of fi:e
organization of all documents, pleadings and
correspondence.

LITIGATION Continue preparation of summary ci
testimony of Mr. Prater from Robilnson v, State
Farm trial.

Continue revision and updating of file inde:.
Research regarding arbitration waiver.

LITIGATION Preparation of summary of trial

I

egtimony of Prater from Rebinson w. State Farm

"t
(b1

ial.
LITIGATION Preparation ol list of exnibics
produced during deposition.

Work on fiie anc f:ile managemsnt; continue
updating angd revising f£ile index.
Supplemental ressarch and craft memorandam
regarding waiver of arcitration provisions
tnrough participatien in litigazion.
LITIGATICN Freparation of indevy of depositio:s
exhibits.

Telephone call with Debbie Dunn regarding
ongoing medical problems: Review medical
reccrds of Linda Rittennouse from Dr. Dega.

REeview madical records recelved; prepare
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Matter Lecger Report Run : 11/11/%9¢%
from 0L/01/80 thru 11/11/99

TLIENT 854385 Bruce B. Sraug

Class Action INIT. ATTY RHG Richarg H. Greener
BILL. ATTY RHS Ricnard H. Greener

RESP. ATTY RHG Richard H. Greener

Claintiffs' Supplemental Responses o
Defendants' First Set of Interrngatories:
prepare Neotice of Service of Discovery
Eesponses; file with court; forward to opposing
counsel; file management; update pleading

docket; open new discovery file.

07/0Z/5¢

trr

u C.4C 26,00 335433 File organization and managemeni; organize
medical records received into Liles of
plaintiffs.

D7/06/98 3 v 0,30 19.50 338745 Review billls fcor pavment; direct tc accouniting;

file management.

0?/07%/9¢k E Li 3.40 2E6.0C 338984 Review memcrandum from handling attorney:

prepare letter to Jim LaRue,
lSH  Mancy Jo Hopkias-  07/07%/98

rm

[ 6,50 52.50 339047 Letter to LaRue regarding deposition of West:
Conference with Dick regarding status of casz,
deposition of West, and fee agreement; Memo Lo
Dick and Jack regarding fee agreement and craft
of letter to Skaug regarding the same.

07/08/9% E U .00 105,00 339231 Flie review and preparation for depositiorn of

Hest.

27416/92 b n 1.0 135,00 346275 Revelw discovery responses from Defendants;

Letter to Defense Counsel regarding discover:;

and deposition of West.

BEC Famele K. Carson 07/16/9¢

L1
o

U G.gi 52.00 34B300 Research dccuments responding to 5tate Farm's
responsa to discovery for handling attorney.
WJi Mancy Jo Hepkins-  07/20/93 E o 1.2 126.0C 349883 Legal research regarding Motion to Comoel in
Insurance Bac Faith Cases; Continue to review
discovery responses from Defendant and memc t.o

paralegal.

ramzia R, Carson 07/20/9% B u L. 4G 42.00 350931 Review additional responses to plaintiffi's
requests for production of documents: compars
anc researcn documents produced and objected
to; prepare working copies for handling
attorney.

DIk Mancy Jo Hopkins-  07/21/9¢ E g 0,50 5%. 50 351470 Review material subiect to the perscnnel

evaluations, underwriting, and claim's courszz.

o, Zyording 077224

,.\.
i
<
=
L)
-
L
[
L=l
(o]
Lan)
i
o
i
[l
—
—

Review documents.

1w
(e
I
~

(%]
b
in
~

Lad
w
I
i
=i}
L

Review Motion to 3tay Procesadings by Defendant:

Conference with Daniel Glvnrn regarding above.

E U LA 125000 357449 Conferences with Dick Greener and Nancy
Garrett; calls te Bruce 3kaug’s office; lettaz:

To Bruce Skaug.

dancy Jo Hepikins- OUS27/08

mw
o

105.00 357398 Review correspondence from Defendant'=z counsal;
Frepars fee split agreement: Arrempred
taelephone call to Bruce A. Davis, consultant.

PR Parzls K. Carson 07/27/%8 E il C.60 3% .00 357441 Flle organizarion and management; update

pleading dockets with current filed pleadings;

teleplicne call te Linda Rittennouse regardilr:
megdical treatment with Dr. Deqa.

Ll danzy o Hopezps- 07727758 £ i .00 21000 357637 Sutline case law for use in preparation of
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Matter Ledger Repcert Kun @ 11712799

From 01/01/80 thre 11/11/99%

INIT. ATTY RHG Richard H. Greener
BILL. ATTY RHG Richard H. Greensr
RESP. ATTY RHG Richard H. Greener

matrer; draft fee agreement.
=R Tamels k. CZarson 07/25/9% E ol .30 18,50 357503 Review file for previous correspondence frem
opposing counsel; prepare copy for handling

atterney.

St Heopkins-  C7/728/88 B i 1,00 105.0C 3573130 Telepnons call te Bruce Daviz, former Siate
Farm Adjustor regarding expert witness 1in case;

ietter to Mr. Davis and memc to file.

tamzla R, C

w

rson CT/31/08 =] U 0.4¢C 26.0C 358490 Review correspondence toc new expert witness
open new subfile for expert witness; file

managemant and organization.

Jo Hepkins~  08/04/98

[ie]
—
—

.00 105.00 365198 Conference with Jack Gjordin, Daniel Glynn and
Richard Greensr regarding tne issue of class
certification.

L. Glynn Og/G4 /94 5 u .40 47,00 366674 Conference with JGG, RHG, and NHG regarding

status of case and response IO MOT10n TO Sta).
S, Sjording 06/04/983 B u ¢.50 75,00 368818 Conference with NJH.

DL Larnie: L. Glynn 08/05/98 E u 0.7 T3.50 365217 Ekeview and revise memorandum in suppert of
class action.
0e/05/98 2] u G.50 52. 50 3o6l2

-~

Meme tc file; Conference with Richard Greenszr;

Final Mem¢ in Support of Certification.

Parelz B Zarson Q5707794 E L _L2C TE. 00 368118 Case management and organizabion; update
pleading docket; telephone call from Jim
Harris' office regarding decision or post trial
motions by State Farm; review decision and
circulate to handling attorneys.

ag/slc/398 B d G

.36 1&.5¢C 3681893 Review memc Irom Jack Gjording; prepare copy of
Memorandum Decision by Judae McKee for review
by Jack Gjioerding.

1JE Nency Jou Hephking-  08/.3/8:2 B U Z.50 262.50 370743 Prepare for and atrend Defendant's Motiorn o

stay proceesdings; Memo to the file and trial
team regarding hearing; Conferencs with Richard
Greener regarding above; Telephone call with
Lefense Counsel regarding depositicen of Scot:
West; Conference with Steve Price regarding
MTC.

SR Pawele R Carsorn 08/13/%9¢8 B ¢ .40 76, G0 371253 Review memorandum from handling atuvorney
regarding outcome of nearing; rosearch
correspondence and attorney notes file for
information on Scott West.

DR/13/796 B I

GB/1a/98 E J

.50 87.50 374120 Conference w/N. Hephkins.

o

@

.80 52.00 372745 Review file; coordinate attorney datss for tos
taking of the deposition oI Scott West; brepare
Hotice of Taking Deposition Duces Tecum of

Scott West.

E U G.as RS 0C 373.7. Review proposed crcer on Defendgant's motion Lo
stay; Lebtrer to the Judge regarding propessd

order,

k. Carson 0%/17/9z2 E u 0.5¢ 3L, 50 373408 Research date for deposition oI SJcott West;
confirm dates for Jack Gjerding and Steve

Frice; celendar deposition; prepare notice of
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Matter Ledger Report Run : li/11i-/99
From 01/01/80 thre 11/13./99

Action INIT. ATTY RHG Richard K. Greenrer
BILL. ATTY RHG Ricparc H. Greenar

RESE. ATTY RHG Richarc H. Creener

taking deposzition cf Scott West; forward to
opposing counsel and file with court.
0d/18/98 E Al U.8G 5%.00 3738

part
L

Revise, finalize and forwarc Wotice cf Taking
beposizion of Scott West, update pleading

docket; file management and organization.

de /2579 E ] G.el £5.0C 381702 Review Motion for Protective Order; Conference
with Daniel and Steve regarding status; Memo i

file.

"
o
b
"
a
=2
i
—
a
o

Jarson AG/27 /788

t
i}

.40 26.00 384125 Review Defendant's Motion for Protective Order
and Memorancum and Notige of Hearing:; confirm
on calendar; update pleading docket and file

marnagemenc.

. Ghording G&/27 /98 E i

€3
ot
L)
el
[anl
(=]
==
ES
fan]
e
o
e
s

Review correspondence; conference wizth Nancy Jo

Hopkins Garrett

Pamsiz R. Carscn 0a/31/98 E u C.az 2¢.0C 3848499 Review Notice of Vacation of Hearing; advise

nandling attcorney; route; update pleading
dockets and file management.

-

Jach 2. Gjording 09/017498 B C G. 60 9G. 00 40%925% EReview correspondance; conference with Nancy Jo

Hookins Garrett
PERT Pamels E. Carson 0oy/06/798 E u 0.30 19.50 393686 Telephone call from Dr. Dega's office regarding

Linda Rittenhouse; telepnone call to Dr. Degs

office regarding accuracy of chart notes and
completeness of record.
09 %179k E U .30

=
[l
L
c
e
f]
L%
-1
[N

kesearcn correspondence file for correspondencs
to and from coppeosing counsegl regarding
producticn reguests; meeting with Daniel Glynn

regarding Motion tce Compel Producticn.

F3

GO Bangy g

ok

o

ns-  0%/21/9% B G .o 25¢.00 402756 TPile review regardino status of matter and MTZ;
Conferaence with RHG regarding above; Conference
with Steve Price regarding above; Conference
witn Dar Glynn regarding above.

CL: CLaniel! . Slvnn 04/21/%k

!
o
3

1 .80 18¢. Qo0 405409 Conference with NHG regarding preparation of
motior to compel: review discovery history.

Oa/22/9% £ u Zoac

405414 Research reggarcding discovery in class actians:
prepare memorandum in support of motion te

compe: .

;

=RT Lamzie W Zzrson D 2o

o
ks
il
v
X
[
-1
[ua
=

404436 Review correspondence te cpposing counsel From
Hancy; research and review file anc compile
aocuments tfor attachment to Mation tec Ccompel
Affidavit by Nancy Hopkins.

T

dJoplins-

m
=
|1
U
[}
L
bt
[
o

405367 Review and revise memprandurm and affidavit in
support of MTC.
LLE Dwnesl L. Slynn 0ar22/ag E U Loe 135,00 195417 Attending "Adjusting the Automekile Claim”
seminar (Bill Helstein speaker)
05703795 = 0 .60 3

[}
=

405418  Review and revise memorandum 1t support of
motion to compel.

= v Z.50 162,50 405567 Review all pleadings files: pull all responsss

= AR LA R Tarsor
and complle package for submission with
Affidavitc on Metion to Compel, meeting with

Daniel Glynn.

i . - - . - - . .- - — . cw
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Frorm 01/01/80 thru 11/11/9%

lass Action IMIT. ATTY RHG Richard H. GSreener
BILL. ATTY RHG Richard H. Greener
RESP. ATTY RHG Richard H. Greener

B u Z2.80 294,00 406089 Continued preparation of materials for metion
tao compel discovery.

08/25/986 B il 0.8C 84.00 409470 Review Motion to Compel materials and preparz
for filing.

a4%./28/98 B u C.7¢ 45,50 409530 Review Motion to Compel; Memorandum and
Affidavit: oper. new pleadings subfile for
motion to compel deocuments; file management.

16/01/9¢8 B U 0.40 26.00 410791 Review pleadings; [ile organizatiorn and
management; update pleadinc docke:.

10/06/98 B U 3. 30 19.50 414870 File corganization and management.

10/08/95 E 4] 0.4C 26.00 41645Z Telephone call frorm Susie at Goicochea's office
regarding status ©f case; prepare memcrandur ro
Dick and Nancy and file.

10/.2/98 B U C.30 1%.5¢C 419671 KReview Notice of Hearing from Defendant's
counsel: confirm and calendar; file management.

10/23/494 B & 0.40 246.00 430380 Telephone call tc Jim Harris' office to
datermine cutcome ¢f hearing or Motion to Lift
the Protective Order of the trial exhibitss
send memorandum to handling attorneys advising
ol Sstatcus.

10/26/9t B U .40 26.00 431448 File management and organlization.

L0/248/98 =] U 1.30 117.00 432852 Meeting with Nancy Hopkins regarding status of
case anc Motion to Compel hearing; telephone
cail to Jim Harris' office regarding Motion to
Lift Protective Order for Release of Documents:
raelephone call to clerk's office regarding
fite; retrieve documents and pleadings
regarding Moticr to Lift Protective Order; fiie
crganization and management.

10/25/%¢8 E T C.60 10%. Q¢ 445281 Review pernalng motions.

12/06/98 5 C .40 70.00 448210 Conference w/N. Yopkins.

ti/148798 B L] 5,30 19,57 14257¢ EReview correspendence to Attorney Skaug
regarding fee and cost structure; update
correscondence board and file management.

1./715/098 B o] .30 il 444174 Work on Motion to Compel.

L1/16/90 B 0 20U a0 445425 Artend Motion to Compell; Meme to Lile.

11/16/79¢ B al 1,580 L5 445432 Review sll correspondence filas for
corresponcernce referancing speclific deposition
ercerpts of documents regquested oL aeiendants;
raview pleadings; update pleading board and
file crganization.

1116598 B L 220 SEL. G 442132 Prepars for and argue moticon to compel;
conference w/N. Heooking and D. Glvnn.

11/156/98 g G T.40 420,00 448200 Reveiw novice; prepareiargus motion to compel

11/1a/9% B i 2,80 304.5C0 450680 Lrepare materials for nearing on motion to
compel/protective order: conference witih BHG
regarding arguments op noLlons; attena hearing.

11/20/9¢ E u 1.50 448474  Review Memorandum Decsesion

12/207%¢ E u .00 250,00 44947% Reveiw Memoranour Decision regarding Metler o
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Matter Ledger Report Run : 11/11/9%9

From 01/01/80 thru 11/11/99

TLIZNT D24ET EBruce B. Zkoug

METTEER €21 Zrarte Farm Zlass Acrion INIT. ATTY RHG Richard H., Greener
BILL. ATTY RHG Ricnhard H. Greener
RESF. ATTY RHG Richard E. Greener

Compel; Telephonse call with RHG regarding
stipulation to vacate trial setting; Telephone
call with opposing counsel regarding
stipulation to vacate trial setting: Draft
proposed stipulation and ccocnvey to opposing
counsel.

ERZ Richazrc M. Greene 11/23/%9% B U 0.70 122.350 468487 Review Memcrandum Decislon re: Discovery;
memorandum to the file.

ELr: Daniel L. Giynn 11/24/95 E ) .20 21.00 6 FReview Memorandum and Order on Discovery.

PR Famzls R, Zarson 1z/01/98 B il

o
()
(=]
—
V=1
un
=

1
55310 Review Memorandum Decision and Order issued oy
judge.
I:T5 0 Manczy Jo Yopkins- 12711798 B ja] .50 62.50 463932 Review correspondence from LaRue regarding
depasition of West and outstanding discovery:
Memc to file; Telephone call with LaRue's

secretary regarding scheduling.

Fameia =, Zarson 1z/21/98 E It 1.50 97 .50 469738 Research and review file; identify and compile
preliminary group of exhibits for use at Scoit

West's deposition.

s
[N
1%}
o
W
==}
i

u .40 65.00C 475521 Review file; organize pleadings and update
pleading board; update correspondence board:
revise and bring current pleading docket.

Gl/04/99 E u

[ed

.BC 52.00 479330 Review file; research deposition exhibites foc
Scott West Deposition; preparation of
additiconal exhibitz.

15,50 4868746 Prepare documents and deposition transcripts
for attorney's preparation of Scott West
deposition.

SE! Sievern B. Price LAL3/9%

01/14/89

PRI Tarele F. Carson 0i/:5/98%

o)
(]
[

.30 310,50 492859  Prepare for Ueposition of Scett West

.80 1,18g.00C 492655 Prepare for Deposition of Scott Wes:t

mow
o

3] 1.040 £5.00C 4878603 Review file te retrieve notes and documents for
deposition cif Scotl West, prepare additional
ceples for deposition exhibits of claims filz

ancd training files.

«
©
-

Price 01/15/99 B 1 7.8C 1, 053,00 492656 Futher preparation for the Deposition of Scooo
West, attend Deposition of Scotit Wes:t.

Lo Tarson ols20/940 4 r 1,60 104.00 492567 Update file index; create new

witness/deposition subfiles; meeting with
handling attorney regarding Scott West
deposition; updats pleading board and

corrrespendence boara: file management.

el
o
o
o
Ps]

[ 01/21/84 B u LDu 493028 Telepnone call from Kosie Stirm regarding
‘ status of hespital bill for Jonn Stirm's last

accidernt and status of bad faith case.

027017585

n

X (ST 52,50 50283% Review correspeondence and case sent by Wayns
Soward.

BEN Famels Fo Carsorn GL/o3/00 E u

-
I
-
I

o
]

5337  Review correspondence from Et Al Invesztigatisns
and Return of Service; file with couart.
/04795 B N ] 162,50 005270 Review &1l correspondence and discovery Tiles;

prepare response memorandum to handling

attorney with list of additiconal proposed




Zosh, humphre,, Greengr & Welsh, FLA4.

Marter lLedger Repor: Run

From 01/01/80 tnru 11/21/99

METTER 001 Ztate Farwm Class Rotion INIT. ATTY RHG Richard H. CGreener
BILL. ATTY RHG Richard H. Greener
RESP. ATTY RHG Richard H. Sreener

witnesses to depose.

02710795 E L G.3C 16,50 508350 Telephone call to Jim Harris regarding exper:t
in State Farm Case; telephone call from Jim
Harris regarding retention of exper:z.

0z/12/89 B u 0.30 15.50 313522 Review file ang¢ research information or Lorectta
Halling and Kevin Kopp status.

03/01/3¢ g v 0,30 19.50 521286 Review correspondence fror cpposing counsel;
research and pul! ccpies ¢l past memorancums

and orders for handling attorney's review,
03/04/9% B it

oy
Lt
b

o

.50 525404 Review letter from Jerry Colcoecnes review

article regarding RICO issues.

03/31/99 E U G.50 32.5C 548331 Review information and ARetna decision rec¢eived
from Soward; distribute coples to handling
attorneys; telephone call to clerk's office
regarding status of reassigament to new Jjudgs;
prepare memorandum tc all internal counsel
handling case; file management.

04/16/8¢ B u £.30 16,50 556271 Review fiie; research previous correspondencs

from Richard Greener tc Jim LaRue and response;

Zile manacement and ocrganization.

=]
.
[
=]
~
o
Iy
[ee)
<

[}

.30 15.5¢C 56953689 File management and organization; cpen subfiles

for Reoper information from experf witness.

K. Greene  0B/05790

s}
-
[y

.00 2,275.0

@

596389 Review File fer Discovery Needs, TC J. Harris,
TC other counsel, Memc to Tile

N3 Tnris Hronberg Jo/15/9% E U c.40 42.00 599372 Review 11/18/9% court crder on discovery,

assoclated correspondence: drafc letrer to

opposing counsel on related discovary issues.

L. Zarson 06/315/949 E ¥ .50 162.56G 600252z File management and organlzatlion; review all
depesiticon exhibits; organize original sealed
depogiticone and plaintiffs' copies of
depositions; update exhibpit index; compile
working copies of deposition exhiblts inte
thres ring binders.

U6/18/9%

(8]

u

o
I
)
v

[
)
o

60>

keview correspondence to oppesing counsel
regarding deposition requirements; updatse

pleading beard and file management.

2616799 B U 3,00 375,00 601140 Conference with CK; File review in preparation

for scheduling future preoceedings.

k. Carson UesL 949 E i

[

.
=
~1
o

5,00 60.427 Research and review file; compile informaticn
2ac documentation for attorney's meeting to

review case Status.

Lianoery 06717759 = o J.7C 73,50 601476 Conferernce with N. Hepkins re status of cess,

discovery.

JoooHopliins- Q9717799 b Il 2,00 375.0C 601745 File review anc meet with CK to schedule cas=

proceedings:memo to fiie regarding objectives.

[ Crris Kronberg Oe/1b/9% E u G.40 2L CE 602692 Teleconference with J. Wilpur's clerk
conference with PC re case status, discovery
issues,

Carson Ou/15/99 B u

ra
5z}
—
[=3]
[

(5

602727 Recrganize witness and deposition fiies; revieow

pleading gockets and complle intc master:
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From 1/01/80 thru 11/11/9%

05455 Bruce 2. Skauc

1 State Farm Tiasy Actich INIT. ATTY REG Richard K. Greener
BILL. ATTY RHG Ricnard K. Greener
RESF. ATTY RHG Richard H. Greener

update and crganize computer directors and
create document management directory: updats
deposition and exhibit blneers; review
discovery files and discovery documents

produced,

=
o
)
o
o
o
m
=
gl
tw
=

0 149,50 603282 Update deposition exhipits and master exhibit
notebook: research change sheets and
verification pages for claims adjuster
depositicns.

CE/22/9% B U 1,00 65.0C 604144 Work on file and file maintenance and

organizaticn; telephone call from Jim Harris

regarding scheduling to come and logk at fils;
coordinate with Jennifer; prepare update and

meme Lo handling attorney with status.

[wv]
T
-2
L
o
m
[}
1
A
P}
[el
-
U
felud

60464t  Meeting with Jim Harris to review file; pull
reievant documents and claims files for his

review per Dick Greener's autheority.

05724794 E U G.20 21.00 60583% Conference with M. Hopkins, R. Greener re case
status.

Hl-  kancy Jo Ropklns-  06/24/9Y E v 0,50 62.5¢ 605916 Conference with RHS and KK regarding status =%
matter; Attempted telephone call with opposing
counsel, left message.

27701799 E U 0.50

<)
(%]

$ .50 609579 Conference with REG regarding depositions anid
discovery; Review file for discovery
depesitions te be noticed,

N3/0679

E

[#i}
Lt
[a=]

]
L
-1
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o
[l
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-
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[
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I

keview correspondence received from cpposing

counsel; Conference witn RHGE; Review OQrder from

f Ceourt; Review propounded discovery; Oraftc
letter tce opposing counsel regarding positian
on discovery and depositions.

07/07/9% E I 1.0 125.00 615562 Review and resview discovery regussts; Continus
to revise letter te Plaintiff's attorney
regarding discovery: Suprems court review ol
Fotinson v State Farm, reed t¢ return, case is

yet to be docketed.

se/95 n 4 T :

LR 6l6:4% Review documents Robinson &t SUprems court.

4
sle AL Larson 07/08/5% o i BN Ze. 00 010475 Review correspondence from LaRue; review
correspendence To LaRue; review Hotise of
Feassignment and Notloce cof Btatus Confarence
Ifrom Judge Wilper; file manzagement and

organlzation.

FRI Talecis B Rdward 07/12/9% B u G.oo 4% .30 617173 Organize and index appeal documents re:
Kobinson v. State Farm

FJH  Hanoy W07 Hopkins- 077127994 E

z.00 375,00 617412 Review documents received from Svpreme Court.

[
(el

i ERY bamsls K. Carvsorn 07/13/390 E .50 32 .50 61764% Finalize angd file Motion teo Amend, Affidawvirn
ard proposed Fourth Amended Complaint; several
calls to Judge Wilvper's office to confirm
hearing date; ieave messages.

[ W ] L L 040 26,00 €18d60 Telephone call from Martha, Judge Wilpex's

j secretary regarding hearing con Motian to Amend
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Matter Ledger Repor:t Run @ 11/11/9%

From 01/01/80 thru 11/11/99

Shaug

Class Action INIT. ATTY RHG Richard il. Greener
BILIL. ATTY RHG Richard #. Greener
RESF. ATTY RHG Richard K. Greener

Compiaint - Substituting Estate of Jonn Stirm;
amend and finalize Hotice of Hearinao for

handling attorney's signature.

W7k Mancy Jo Hopwxins-  07/16/99

m

£ 2,540 31Z.5

el

621844 Draft discovery; Scheduling conference

memorandum; Telephone call to Opposing counssl.
Pk Pamelz E. Carson 07/19/9%9 B U G.

=3
[}
[
3]

.ac 622030 Review Plaintiff's Status Conference
Memorarndum; update pileading docket and pleading

subfiles; [iie crganization and management.
J¥ itezncy Jo Hoplinz-  0%/19/99 E v 2.8

o
()
n
(=]
(o]
[
[=a)
ra
X
o)
el
()

Conference with RHG regarding status of matter;
Review Memorandum filed by Defendants regarding
scheduling conference; Revise discovery
reguests.

FEZ Felscia R, Eaward 07/19/99 B a C.

51}
[}

27.50 622147 Work on zssemblage of discovery responses re:

new morion to compel,

Pamela R. Carson 07%/20/98 B U c.7c 45.50 622719 Review attorney memorandums regarding
additional discovery proposed; file management
and update attcorney notes file: televhone calls
from Dedra and Rosie regarding status of estate

and status of trial.
I Hancy 4 Hopkins-  07/21/9% B 15

[

GO 378,00 623557 rinal and file supplemental discovery and
reguests to supplement; Telephone call with

Court and opposing counsel X3.

[]
-l
[
o
o
[i]
=

oo 125,40 G26850 Conference with RHGC regarding status of matter;

Continue to prepare for Status Conference.

Famegla k. Carson 07726/99 B il G50 3z.50 627348 Fiie management and organization; update
rleading docket.
HTIH O Nancy S Hopkins-  07/29/89 E u 3.00

[
)
%]
(=)
&

62387499 Prepare for and attend the status cenference.
FRZ Famels P. Carson 01/03/99 B Bl C.6e0 3%

w
[

633373 Flle menagement and organization; update
witness files and organize; update pleading
docket and log.

ATE Heno Jo Hoplins-  08/33/99 B o Z.50 31z.50 636867 Conference with RHG regarding status of mattz:s

Hevise 30bpf Notice.
/047949 E U .00 623,00 £36907 Conference with RHC regarding scheduling of
discovery; Revise 30b6 Notice; Conference wizh
Jon simmons redarding overview of case.
Q67068756

[l
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Final 30kt Notice: Conferencze with RHG
regarding notice and The Stirm estate; Review

| correspondence from opposing counsei; Telephone
[

|

c&ll to opposing counsel.

Famela 1. Zarson QE/06 /8%

[n]
o
L2
]
e
w
o
b
@
—
o
o

Finalize 30(b) (6] Notice of Takino DeposiTic:
to Staete Farm; update pleading docket and fiis

management .

E il DL £ EH] 64107%  Research anc review correspondence and pleading
Tile; updasts pleading docxket and correspendsnco

noard.

Har:zw Jo hoghkins- 08/15/80 E il

o
o
[=3

t
5

641907 Letters to clients regarding status of mettned.
FRT bamola . Carson 0z/18/39 J

-
[
[
[l
()
wr

Lo 644404 Review corresponaence from nandling atrtorney o
clients; update correspondence beard: fiis

management; telephons call from court reports

in Illinois; fax copy of Notice of Depositio
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Matter Ledger Report

From 01/01/80 thru 11/11/8%
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Page: 30
Rur: @ 11/11/9&

INIT. ATTY RHG Richard H. Greener
BILL. ATTY RHG Richard LK. Greener

RESP. ATTY RHZ Richard E. Greener

(&
o
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549037

644006

655730

662165
6622472

6G2EAL
662351
663676

663400

671893

30tb) {5} of State Farm toc court reporter.
Review Defendant's responses to Plaintiff's
10th Interrovgatories and ilth Reguest for
Froduction.

Review responses t¢ Defenadnts' Objecstions,
Answers and Response to Flaintiffs' Tenth Ser
oI Discovery; update pleading docket; open
subfliies for discovery requests and responses;
file management.

Review file; prepare Mcticn to Compel Discovery
Responses; prepare AZfidavit of Counsel;
research languace for memorandum; update
pleading and file.

File organization; update correspondence and
attorney notes.

Conf W. Hepkins and C. Kronberg;

Cenference with RHG and CK regarding status of
matter, 30bb6 depositicn to be deone by RHG, and
mction to cecmpel to be filed by CK.

TC J. Larue, emmec to file

Draft/research motion to compel.

Email to MW re assistance in cholating
documents for motion te compel.

Conf M. Hopkins, Ltr te J. Larue

Conference with Chris Kroaberg regerding MTC.
Conf. with NH re discovery responses from
defencdants: review emails re our efforts o
compel production and pravicus productions.
Two telephone calls Erom Judge Wilper's office;
schedule hearing chanog and confirm with
handling attorneys; prepare for filing BAmends=d
Notice cf Hearing.

File management and organizatiorn; update
pleading docket and pleading board:; phons
conversation with Jim Harris regardinc
information needed: review Linda Rittenhouse
and Castellanos claims files for information
regarfing paper review companies and denied
claims.

Review memorandum from Carciyn Baldino
regarding scheduled depositicns in Bloomingt oo
review correspondence file tor letter from
Larue regarding depositions.

File organization and managemen: of claims

fiies; continue review of claims files for

o
L

pleintiifs regarding chiropractic biilis and
causation.

Review Discovery Response to 30bé Notice, Menc
te . Krernberg and N, Hepkins

Cunf M. Hopkins re motion to compel, memo to O
o2



Cosno, Humphrey, Zreener & Welsh, FLA.

UndB3 Bruce B. Skaug

001 Stats Farm Class Actich

o Famela f. Carsor 0g/,27/95 g U
09/24/99 E u

Q9/30/99 B J

WJH Maney Je Hopkins-  0%/30/89 B u
Famela R. Carson 10/0479% B i

Richard k., Sreens  10/04/9¢

w

L4 10/04/78¢ B L}
FRC  Famela K. Carson 10/05/9% B U
KHZ Richarc H. Greene 10/05/99 =] Y
Ci 10/0e/99 3 I
[ i 13/08/90 3 i
o < Kronberg L0/06/85 E Ll

13/06/499 2 L
RhES Richard B, Sreene 10/6G5/99 8 U

Matter Ledger Report

From 0L/01/B0 thru

11/11/6%

Page: 31

Run @ 11/11/G%

INIT. ATTY RHG Richard k. Greener
BILL., ATTY RHG Richard H. Greener
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ATTY RHG Richard H. Gresner
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679442
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€8016C

680255

680257

Kronberg re motion to compel

Telephone call from Jim Harris regarding
documentation reguest; segregate, organize and
compile coples of all chiropractic bills for
all ciaimants for review by Jim to compare to
Mercy Guidelines.

Review memorandum from Dick Greener: review zll
documents produced by cpposing counsel for
defendants; complle and corganize doCuments
referenced in Defendant's objection to Rule
30{b} 16, depositions of State Farm; complete
copying of claims files, i.e. chiropractic
2ills for meeting with Jim Harris; meeting with
Jim Harris regarding claims files.

File management and organization: review memc
from Hancy Hcpkins: prepare letter to Jim La%ue
regarding documents for 30(b} (6) depositions:
prepare draft interrogatories and reguests for
production of documents to cpposing counsel for
delendants.

Review and draft Int's and Rip; Memo to file
and RHG.

Finalize discovery and process for forwarding
to defendants' counsel and £iling with court.
TC J. LaRue; COnf . Hopllins, Review Ds pap=r
re motion tc comple

Cenference with RHG regarding moticn to comp=zl.
keview, amend and finallize discovery for filing
with court; prepare and forward to opposing
counsel; prepare MNotice of Service and file.

TZ J. La Rue, Review email from N. Hoplins,
Prepare for Hearing an Motiorn to Compel
rreparation for hearing orn motion to compel.
Review and research pleading files and compile
docaments for handling atctorney's preparaticn
for hearing on Plaintiff's Metion to Compel;
meeting with handling attorneys regarding
objeccicons to discovery requests by defendanns;
rrepare Second Amended Not:ce ol Hearinc on
Moticn to Compel and forward to opposing
ccunsel; file with court; prepare ietter for
Richard Greener's signature to Bruce Skavg with
& comy to Jerry Goicoechea.

Telegon. with J. Larue re amendment to
complaint; coni. with P. Carson re same.

Conf. with RG re potential setrtlement, 30(biif)
depc notices.

Lir to B. 5kaug re Settlement; Work on
Settlement Proposal, Zonf M. Hopkins, CCPmt C/

Kronberg



Tosiie, Huronrey, Greenery (o Welsh, F Fage: 3z
Matter Ledger Report Run : 11/11/9%
From 01/01/8GC thru 11/X1/99
CLIENT 04482 EBruce B. Skaug
o 00 State Farm Cliess Action INIT. ATTY RHG Richarc H. Greener

2I1L. ATTY RHG Richard H. Greener

RESF. ATTY RHZ [Richard H. Greener

T4 Mancy Jo Hopkine-  10/06/799 E o Z.00 250.00 682290 Conference with REG; Conference with CK and Pam
Carson ir preparation for Motion to Compel;
Revise letter tc Skaug with regard to status of
matter; Set meetings for clients.
10/11/88 B J 1.00 125.00 684124 Meet with Dedras Stirm; Meme tc RHG regarding

Stirm and Vandenhuevel.
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10/11/99 B u Z.30 149,50 fE4140 EReview Objections by Defendants; review
discovery resgponses and exhibit list from
Robinsor v. State Farm to getermine what
documents have been produced, are available to
be preduced for meeting with handling attornsys
in preparation for Motion to Compel hearing.
[J: Nancy Jo Hopiins-  10/12/9¢ s U 1.50 187.50 684364 Memo to file regarding Dedrz Stirm, Grace
Vandenhueval; Memo to Pam Carson and begin
graph for use in evaluating the claims with
regard to settlement.
I Thris Kronberg 10/13/99 E U

wl

-1 399, 0¢ £85469 Review documents in preparatiorn for motion o2

compel hearing.

amzla B Carscn 10/14/959 E 11

(3]

G 4550 685691 Review files with Chriz Kronberg in preparatiorn
for Motlorn rto Compel hearing.
dhi diency Jo Hopkines- 10G/14/89 E [ 1.00 L25.00 685992 Conference witn RHC regarding settlement;
Conference with CK regarding MTC.
[yt Zhris Wronberg 10/14/99
10/14/9%

12JH Nancy Jo Hopxins- 10715789

G 1.30¢ 13
L16 43

m

LS50 686392 Appear in court tc argue meotion to compel,

[
0.50 686403 Preparation for hearing on motion to compel.

oo
2
.

9l .00 125.00 667221 Telephcone call withk Debbie Dunn and letters to

Rittenhouse and Castellanos.

Famala R, Carson 10/25/34 E U .30 1¢.50 687267 Review file regarding substitution of estate:
update hancling attorney.

HTH  Hanay Jo Heplins- 10416789

w
—
I
i
)
(9]
—
wn
o
o
o

-3
o
e
[Re]

Conference witn RHG; Dreft letter to Dedra
Stirm regarding settlement and SOL on wrongfal
geath claim; Review cbjection of Def's
regarding 30bo.

FRZ Tamzlz k. Carson 13418/

o
Iy
m
(g
=
L

[y
@
x
o
[+l

6876884 Review file; prepare letter to Estate of Jchn
Svirm regarding settlement suthorizy;draft
authority release document; xesearcn Oppositiorn
to Rule 36(bi Depositions and provide to
handling attorney Greener; upcdale pieading

docket and correspondence board.

T Hoprans-o 1008760 E Al .30

666722  Tinal and send letter te Dedra Stirm.

ot

]

1/

S

4 5 E [y 0,47

£908%5 Heview correspondence Iroem Dedra Stirm; predare
letter to Dedra Stirm; file management and
update correspondence filg.

ilCi o Wanoy Jo Hopkins-  18/21/99 B 5 s.oo 1z%.00 691165 Telephone call with Bankruptcoy trustee

regarding Castellanos XI; Review and responi i

letter received from Dedra Stirm Healy.

RC Pamnela K.

10/22790

m
L}
)

;.40 26.00 592193 Create subfile for Department of Insurance
Informaticn; prepare duplication of
correspondence and authorization from Dedra

Scirm for Dick Greener's review.

<
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Ln
131
[

—

)

1%, 20 £4Y28R% Review memo from handling attorney; compile
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Phmraelc Carson 10/2575¢%

Honzy T Bopkins-  10/728/9G
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Page: 3z
Rur @ 1:i/11/9u

TNIT. ATTY RHG Richard H. Greener
BILL. ATTY RHG Richard H. Greener
RESP. ATTY RHG Richard H. Greener
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E96TED
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697215

6974097

ERTRLG

£99905

708122

711107

T1111C

documents for review by nandling attorney to
develcp issues statement.

Preparation for and conference witn cliente
ragarding settlement negotiations and review
ciaim files in preparaticn for settlement
negotlations,

Research and locate previous e-mall regarding
dazes of loss for Nancy Hopkins.

Prepare graph for mediation regarding clients;
Telephone call with Jim lLaRue regarding 3Cb¢
and mediation, Mowv. 1., :999: Telephone call
with Dick regarding meaiation; Letter to Lakus
regarding above; Telephone call to Judge Hart
Judge McKee, Tony Park and Walt Bithell
regarding mediation; Telephone call with staif
for LaRue regarding above avallability; Letter
tc Skaug regarding abowve; Letter to all clients
regarding akove; Calendar ahove,

Letters tc all clients setting forth an
agreement for settlement minimum; Telephone

calli with Jim LaRue Xz, Telephone call witn RHG

o8]

HZ.
File management and prganization: update
correspondence file and notes file: update
pleading docket and sort out duplicates of
pieadings.

Telephone call with Jim LaRue and nis staffl M3
Talephone call with staff for Jim Gllliesple
regarding mediation date; Telephone call with
staff for Judge Harg{:; Letter to all clients
regarding mediation; Meet with Frank

Castellanos; Conference with RHG; Continue

review files and prepare mediation graph.

Conf M. Hoplins, 7C J. Thompson, Memc to fils

Telepnone call with Jerry G. and Bruce 5., lzft

messages; Telephone call with Jeff Thomsen:

Conference with RHG.

File management and organization; update

pleading docket.

Review correspondence re 30bém conf N hHoplins

re satilement brochure ocutline

Telepnone calls tc clients regardinc mediationg

letrer to clients; Telephone call to opposing

counsel; ContTinue to review and work on 30be

aeposition sections.

kegarding mediation schedale: Telephone call

with staff for Skaug; Telephone call with

Skaug; Telephone call with Rittenhocuse,

Castellanas, left message [or Jose; letiers o
c

all clients regarding mediavion; Begin draft of



Coshe, Hotpnrey, Greener & Welsh, PUk. Page: 34
Matter Ledger Report ) Rup @ 11/1.790
Crom Q1/01/80 thru 11/11/%%

TLIENT 02427 Bruce E. Skaug
MATTER CG0: Ztate Farm Class Rcoction INIT. ATTY RHG Richard H. Greener
BILL. ATTY RHG Richard H. Greener
RESEF. ATTY RHEG Richard H. Greener
mediation statement; Letter to Opposing counsel
regarding 30b&.
CRE %. Edward 11/02/8¢ E U 0.80 44 .00 713233 Telepinone call with Bertha at Golcoethea [.2:

Draft letters to all plaintiffs for attorney

review {.6;

=57 Rachawd . Crezene 11403708 B U C.8C 140.0cC 713384 Tc J. LaRue, COnf M. Hopkins,

TF Nancos Jo Hogkins- 117037859 B il .00 250.0C 714604 Continue to prepare for mediation; Telephone
call with LaRue; Conference with RHG; Telephons
call with Debby Dunn, Linda Rittenhouse, anc
emplover for Frank Castellaros: Telephone cai.
with Bruce Skauaq.

1./34/94 B C Z.040 235.00 714606 Draft mediation statement.

FRT O Tamelz K. Carson 1i704/949 B U G.3C 15.50C 714911 Telephone call from Jim Harris regarding
additional reguest for information; e-mail Dicl
Greener and Nancy Hopkins regarding reguest.

FRT Folesia B, Edward  11/04/0% E ol 2,00 11G.00 71491% Prepare mediation notebooks for NJH and RHG;
Review and organize claim files in preparaticn
oI mediation.

THE Richare t. Greene 11705796 B u LLi0 197,50 71524% cConf N. Hopkins, Tc J. Gillespie, TC J.
GCoicorchea; Review Fllez for Mediation

iidn MNancy Jo Hophkins-  11/0h/549 3 u &.0C l,000.0C 712345 Continue to review file and prepare draft of
mediation statement.

PET Famezloe I Carscn 12/05/8% E o 0.70C 45.5G 715622 Put together discovery files and claim files
for Nancy's review for preparation for
mediation.

TR Flchard | Gresne  11/06/9% B u I.2C 3ge.0C 715657 Work on settlement brochure, Review Files

11708/28 = & 2.40 420.00 715628 Work on settlement conf preparation
11710754 = L Z.40 420,00 714453 Tc J. LaRue, Tc J. Gelcoechea; Prepare for
5ettlement COnf; Ceonf . Hoplins
BILLARLE 923,11 9l,268.32
C.oo 0.00
.00 0. 00
OVEL 923.1% 8., 26£.35

-------------------------------------------------------- EITLLERL L S e

o LATE cohE STS HOORE 5 VRLUE TASK RET 4 TEXT

JouL Mizzelisncous OlS3i/ % j B 354.5%

EILLABLT 2.006 354,52
NCH=-2ILIEELE .00 .00
L.oo G.oa
L.oo 354,58




Zosno, Humphrey, Greener & Welsh, Z.A. Page: 1
Matter Ledger Report Rup @ 11/11/9&
From 01/01/80 tnru 11/11/99

Farm Zlass Action INIT. ATTY RHG  Richard H. Greener
BILL. ATTY REG Richard E. Greener
RIESF. ATTY RHG Richard k. Greener
——————————————————————————————————————————————————————————— E¥ FEHNZSEEZ S--memmmmmr e e e e e e s e e
TOoE HAamMI DATE 3Ts § VALUE Ck & REF 4 EXT
0L Phorocoples 04/29/3% u 143,60 566608
0E/16/9Y 1 C.60 601345
06/17/95% i 7E.4C 601374
U6/23/54 G £.80 604720
d6/24 /99 U 55.00 506541
03/08/9% n 182.40 616540 copies from the idaho Suprems Zourt Law Libra
07/13/99 u 12.00 618765
07/14/59 u G.60 622435
07/16/9% v 1.20 €2ruz¢
07/:9/9% u 4.40 6222549
07419799 U 0.10 622425
074197599 g i.00 62723%
07/21/89 U .10 627241
0%,/21/99 U E.80 623437
0G/06/ 5% 8 160 £38453
08/17/%% Q0 1,40 644329
4G/15/9% u 20.40 BE50TE
08/20/9% U G3.940 668119
ZINT interest 04/23/99 u 39C.73 671276 thruo 0%/25/99
COFD Photoooples 0%/28/99 U 21.16 674340
05/29/94 v 4.60 674547
10/04/99 i G 10 678370
10/05/9% U .00 675562
10/036/9% i E.60 682315
10/06/9% L .00 682445
16/14/99 N .30 BRE420
10/25/ 9 2 Z.00 694747
i 10/25/9% U 390.72 £94112 cthru 10/25/8%
10726799 U P 4] 696540
10/27/9% i &. 00 £96914
11/047949 U S. 00 714980
875 Cther Bil.iaczls 11/05/9¢ U 12,40 10547 715294 Hancy Jo Bopkins-Garrett; HMileage/Nampa; INVOTTL

#11/5/854:11/035/99
1:/05/99 n 2E.CC 10547% 715291 Nangy Jo¢ Hopkins-Garrett; lunch w/bunn &
EKittenhouse; INVOICE #11/3/%94;11/05/59
Photcoopies 11/08/90 u 1a.00 716437
11/09/79% U 134.4¢C T1760¢

toes/Witne 12/10/99 U 14540 10€3% 718012 Wayne L. Soward: ;INVOICE #Hernandez wv.
str11/01/96

TOEY FLovoooplias 11/10/9% U 249,00 TLETON
AUVALCEL 18%.80
WCH-CAShH 1,543.66
TOTRL L 72746



Zosnho, Humphrey, Greener & Welsh, P.A. Page: Z

Matter Ledger Report Run : 11/11./9%
From 01/01/80 thru 11/11/99%

TEE L41 Stzte Farm Class Action INIT. ATTY RHG Richard H. Greener
BILL. ATTY RHG Richard H. Greener
RESP. ATTY RHG Richard H. Greener

LLED EXTFEHNSE Boomomom oo e e e e e e e o
ToDEL NAME DATE 8T: S VALUE CH 4 REF # TEXT
01/08/96 B £.40 11574¢
01/10/56 E .20 115371
i Loy Lrstance 01710796 E 0.45 1155315 Long distance charges to 208/466-00230 -

Attorney Bruce 3Skaug

21/11/8¢ E .45 113986 Long distance charges to 208/466-0030 (Bruce
Shkaug:
ZOTY Protocopies 0L/12/96 8 165.20 116026
CR Cthex Billable 01/12/986 B T.00 122567 Milt's 9th S5Street Sandwich Shop; Lunch Meeting;
cneck 95873
J0PY FPhotccopies 0z/14/96 B S.60 117185
01/14/96 B 0.20 117167
01/16/96 E 5.40 116251
o3zl Otner RBillable 01/17/9¢ E BC.8C 116898 Capital Copy & Print
COFY Phaortocopies 01/17/9¢ B 1.80 116272
01/17/96 B .20 122550
Di/16/96 B 45.00 122552
01/19/9% E 1.20 116521
FREY =zfrevious Ba:. 01/25/96 E 7,072.32 114406 Previcus Balance
L Long Distance G1/2579¢ B C.43 116934 Long distance call to 2068/446-0300
COPY Phctocoples 0l/Z6/3¢ B G.40 114678
0./30/9¢6 B £.00 15021
DE Crimr Billable 01/31/96 51 30C. 05 1151580 Capitel Copy and Print 01/22/9%
DOEY Fnoronopias 0z/06/ %8 E 1.20 104€07
02/07/986 B 39,20 122518
G2/07/9¢ B . BO 1034792
02/07/96 B 24,60 104790
0z/0v/96 B 100 104722
Q2/0%/96 E 1.60 104910
o Ot Blllakiie C2/097/9¢ B 156.20 105734 Wayne L. Goward
0z7.2/8C B 1Z.8¢ 122534  Lunch Meeting; Nancy J. Hopkinz-Garrett: Checi
H96L1E67
02/15/94% E 720 105236
Fa: G2/1e/9¢6 3 2,00 104378
FhoteZoples 0Z2/20/96 E L.06 105358
153 Ouher Biliable 02/21/9¢6 E 20.80 12253% Lunchk with client; Nancy J. Hopkinz-Garrett;
check #96227; P
TCUY Bhatooopies 0Z2/2a8/53¢ B 113,48 108652 Capitcl copy and print 02/0%
02/28/%6 B .60 137952
L2,/2u/06 E 1.00 106680
COUT Phrnooopies 0D3/0479¢ B 2.80 108087
03704796 B 0.40 108089
Long Listancs DA/05/56 B 225 111323
Tan 03/06/ %0 B .0C 106E3E
ZOUY Photocopies 03/06/08¢ B 3.80 108228
03/0B/96 B G.60 107203
04/08/546 E 45,00 16719%
C3/06/9¢ E 35.00 107198



Tomnn, Burohrey, Sreeper o Welsh, FLUA. Page: E
2r Ladger Report Rur - 11/31°G0

1/0./80 thru 11/11/9%
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CLIENT 08485 Brues B. Skaug
MATTER CGCL State Famn Class ACtion IWNIT. ATTY RHC Richarc H. Greener
BILL. ATTY RHG Richard H. Greener
H

RESP. ATTY BHG Richard Greener

33/08/56 B 8.80 137128
EW P 03/08/9%a B 1.00 106885
U351 /96 E .00 106941
TGN, Prneotocopies Q3/.3/96 E 0.60 107318
FA Tax 03713790 E .00 107018
oY Phiotocopies 03/25/96 E B SH 108750
03/27/9¢ B 15.00 10887¢&
03/27/%¢ B C.4c 10833¢C
03/27/9¢ -] 17.2C 108847
03/27/5¢6 E 113.83 108723 Capitol copy and print 03/20/96
03/27/94 B 4.20 108627
03/27/8¢6 E 107,73 108719 <Capitol cepy and print 02/08/96
03/258/9¢ E 17,80 108882
AL Tan 03728746 <) .00 109058
COFY Photosopies 03/28/5¢ = 10,80 108881
03/29/96 B 94.60 106426
03/29/96 E 49,80 108424
Fai 03/2%/9¢6 E 3.00 10907¢
COPY Fhorocopies 03/29/96 B 31C. 60 108427
04/01/9% a8 L.60 108791
04/01/96 2 5.60 109789
04L/01796 B G.40 109787
04/01/96 B 1.2¢ 109786
D4/02/9% E 45. 00 109847
04/03/9¢ B 12,00 1098896
047037496 2] Z.00 109835
04/03/9¢6 B 80.00 108615
04/05/9¢% B G.60 108926
04/05/9¢ B 22.40 122642
(14 /09796 5 3,352.97 110998 Wayne L. Soward April and March Fees
04/09796 B 226.69 110999 Capitol Copy and Print 02/08/96 $107.73
03/28/9¢ $B.50 03/
SR Jthey Billable 04:09/96 E 232,82 116957 Alphagrapnics White Bond Inwv. # 933
Q4711796 B £.0 111000 pParking Fine chesk f96842
TA Fa:: Da/l6/96 51 L.ooe 108768
oE Otter Billaple N4/:29/9¢6 B 4p. 00 111002 MNancy J. Hopking-Garrett Meals during
deposition check #965%
D4419/9¢ j2] .00 111002 FParking Fine Durinag Deposition check #96897%
TOPL Pholocoples 0d /197594 E 3.60 11079%
34/198/8¢ B z.ac 116766
Fa 04/15/96 B 7.00 110z7¢
ot oncpies J4/19,9¢ E 5. B 110771
nl listancs 04/19/56 i .70 118312
COYY O PROLOCOpies 04,/23/84 B C.BG 11096%
QE Other Billaole 04/23/96 B 15.31 11138% pancy J. fdopkins-Garret: dinner with L. Lunn
Couri Reporter 04/25/9¢ = 687.0C 111391 ODeposition costs for Marvir J. iarding
0G4/25/49¢ 2 312,88 11239% Deposition costs for W. John Strim
(4/25/8¢C <] 782.0C 11239C Deposition costs for J. Harding iconfidertiat:
CnLY Thuoooplen G4/ 3 F.00 111733
04/26/96 L 5.40 111660
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05707794
05/08/9¢6
05/08/9¢
05/09/%¢6
03/15/96

05/17/96
05/18/9¢8
05/21/9¢
05/21/9¢
05/21/%¢
03/21/96
05/22/9¢
05/22/9¢
05/22/9¢
03/23/96
05/23/9¢6
05/23/9¢
05/2%/9¢
03/30/94
CL/30/96
05/30/9¢
05/30/9¢
CH/30/98
05,/30/98
03/30/5¢6
05/31/59¢6
Ge/03/90
06/03/59¢
06/03/9¢
D6/04/98
DE/04/9¢E
06/G5/9%
Ge/05/56
06/06/9¢

Go6/14/9¢6
06/24/9¢
GYSL5/90
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07723786

27/26/98

07726796

08/ 06/56
08/06/38
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Matter Ledger Repor:
From 01/01/80 thru 11/11/99
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.10
.z2e
.60
.80
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112038
112042

119594
119273
118123
118180
118455
122915
122917

12281Z%

122808

122911
122908

118677

12049

Page: 4
Rur, @ 11/11./%%

INIT. ATTY RHG Richard H. Greener

BILL. ATTY RHG Richarcd H. Greener

RESFE., ATTY RHG Richard H. Creener

Capitel Copy and Print 4/29/936

Deposition costs for Deborah J. Lunn

Medical Records Retrieval check #97255 Memorial

Hospital J.

Bil: #5/6 J.35tirm; Memorial Hospltal; Medics.

Records: Szirm

Photocoples

Photocepies

Bill #LRittennous; laahc Ells

0D7/09/96 state

Rehat Hospital:



Coshic, Humphrey, Greene

CLTEMNT J8448% Brucee E. 3
METTER 931 Stare ©

r & Welsh,

E

08y

Pnotcooplies

OB Cuoher Billlable

CORY Dhetoccples

N

LD Fhwtooronles

08/08/9¢
08/21/9¢
05/04/98
09/04/79¢
09/16/9¢
09/16/79%
06/20/9¢
10/02/96
13/14/8¢
10/22/46
12/16/9¢
12/16/9¢%
2i/104/97
01/24/97
02/05/97
02/21/97
02/26/97
C2/28/87
02/03/797
03703/97
03/05/97

03/26/97
04/02 757
Da/03797
04/733/97
04/03/797
01718797

04721497
0b/06/97
05/08/97%
05/08/97
N5/08/97

5/12/97

C3/L2/9%

a5/13/97

05713797

S/LL/97
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Matter Ledger Report

from 01/01/80 thru 11/11/98

.80

iy

o

ey

i

.60
.00
. 8E
.20
.20
.00
.00

.40
.20
.40
L20
.20
-1y
L0

LB
L0

.00

20

5.20
.20
.60
B0
.60
.31

I
U

.60
LAD

INIT. ATTY RHG
BILL. ATTY RHG
RESP. ATTY RHG

Kichard h. Greener
Richard E. Greener

Richarc H. Greener

126817
12830C
129057
129590
130668
130644
131078
132046
133206
1342153
139982
140004
144947
1456746
163558
163661
18370¢
153742
163733
163736
16372¢
163762
163768
163769
163850

1639509

164325
164427
164570
164564
164552

164636

164637

Bill #9/26-9/27; Sowardc, Wayne L.; edpert fes

Bill #10/31-10/2%;

Eil: fHernandzCCT; Soward, Wayne L.; expert rLee

Soward, Wayne L.; supert fee

Cneck #1008.7; Edwards, Felecia R.;

reimpursemant for luach

Check #100E538:; Hepkinz-Gzazrrett, MNancy Jo;
parking, Castellan
Bill #40769%; Harmon Travel: airfare/ G,

Vandenheuvel

Bill #10&682; Burnham, Habel & Asscciates,

Inc.; depc of Fra

Checl: #1015308; Hopkins-Garrett, Rkancy Jo; lunch
during Vande
Cnecl #101506; Hoplkins-Garrett, Nancy Jo:

pariing garing Varn



Comng, Remphrey, Greener & Welsn, PLUA. Fage: 6
Matter Leager Report Run @ 11/%.7449
From 0L/01/8BC thru 11/11/86

CLIZHY [R8425 Bruce B. 2kaug
MATTEL 001 State Farm Jlass Action INIT, ATTY RHG Richard E. Greener
EILL. ATTY RBG Richard E. Greener

RESP. ATTY RHG Richard K. Greerer

CLilesav 2] G.60 164700
05/19:97 |5 1.8LC 164727
oF Ouher Eillable 05/29/97 E 12.58 166934 Check #101710; Hopkins-Garrett, Nancy Jo:
lunch/depo of Debb
05/29/97 B 1.50 166932 Check #10171C: Hopkins-Garrett, HNancy Jo;
parking/depc cof De
TR Fan 06/04/97 B 1.C0 166187
TORY PhoLoCopies 0e/09/97 B 1.0C0 1653707
TR Tan 06/09/97 B 3.00 166255
X 06/10/87 B 0.40 166621
0e/20/97 E 5.20 166345
LI Long Listance Cosflz/9% B 4.82 168803
CTRE Court Reporrer 06/16/97 B 95.20 166679 PBill #10834; Burnham, Habel & Associates,
Inc.; depositic
COF: Photoocoples 06/24/97 B CLBC 168102
06/24/97 B 2.2C 168031
0624797 B 11.80 168100
UFZ  zlnited Parcel 06/24/97 B 10.50 168885 United Parcel Service
TTRE ourt Reporter 06/25/97 B 360.40 163483 Bili #10903; Burnham, Habel & Associates,
Inc.: copy of dep
Oy Phuotoccpies 00,/25/97 B 17.80 168438
Oa/Ze/97 E £.0C 168762
UTE zUnives larcel 06/26/97 = 10.50 168877 United Farcel Service
06/26/97 B 15.52 168873 Unitecd Farcel Service
Phiatozaopies Qe/26/97 B 17.40 168760
06/26/97 2] 4.80 168756
06/26/97 B L.BC 16874870
06/27/97 = Z.4C 168727
57/0z/97 B 19.20 170002
57/02/97 B 44,40 170024
007797 B G.20 1698446
03/07/97 5 33,80 169842
0u/07r97 E 20,60 163852
837/08/97 B 24.0C 169651
37/11/797 B 6. a0 170549
0r/14/797 B 1.40 1704849
07/14/97 E 449,80 1704858
07/14/97 3 65.20 170466
07/14/97 =1 50.4¢C 1704638
07/15/797 = 3,60 170411
07/15/97 E G.20 170397
= Trner Eillable SFSLTET B 39.1¢ 170944 EBill #6/17; Capitel Copy & Print:; copies
DIAITSET E 16.83 12333 Bill 47/3: Capitol Ceopy & Print; copies
07177497 = 894,12 170942 pRiL1 #46/1/97; Capitol Cepy & Print; copiles
COFU Phatuooples 03/22/97 B L6l 17201z
= Ouier Billan.ie ar/24 797 = 20.0C 172079 Bill #854330; Department of Labor, 3D, coples
el 07732797 E G.ogl 172806
na/0v/57 B 1.20 17464¢
0e/11/97 E T.2C 177430
05/26/97 B 0,26 180007



sinshn, Humphrey, Creener & Welsh, FLA. Fage: 7
Matter Ledger Report Run @ 11/11 7459

From 01/01/86 thru 11/11/9%

MATTER 00)1 Stece Farm Class hction INIT. ATTY RHG Richard H. Greener
BILL. ATTY RHG Richard H. Greener
RESF. ATTY RHG Richard H. Greener
13/0%/97 E .20 180735
10/21/97 E 1.2C 182328
20721797 B .20 132820
10/22/97 E 5.20 182680
11/04797 B C.BO 184286
11717797 B 4.20 185951
OF Other Biliable 11/25/97 B 20.00 187106 Bill #VandenHeuve; Hager, Dr. Bruce Jon; search
fee
FAM Tam 12/01/97 B z.00 189723
TOPY Pholcooples 12/02/97 E C.40 i68683
12/03/97 E 1,60 188603
12/04/97 B 5.00 188491
Tan 12/04/97 B 5.00 189570
OV Protosopias 22/09/797 B 14.4¢C 188275
12/09/97 E 4.80 188278
12/16/97 B 35.4C 188186
12/10/97 B 284.00 188176
12710797 B 6Z.20 18816%
824 Ctrer Billable 12/12/97 B 17.10 187465 Check #2623; Hopkins-Garrett, Nancy Jo; meals
COPY Photocopies 12417797 B 1:.8G 187766
12718797 B 0.2C 187621
02/24/93 B 20..03 204899 thru 01/22/9%
03/05/9% B 5, 000,00 3541 208849 Sreve Prater; Retainer for evaluation;Tax
ID#770186266; INVOICE #OPER-FRE; 03/05/98
Postage 03/03/93 B 25.00 244067
Photocopies 33/12/94 B £.40 240114
CE Cther Zillable G3/17/98 E 13z2.18 3620 22254: Capitol Copy é& Print; COPIES
; INVOICE #03/03/958;03/03/98
TOrY Pnotecoplies Q3/19/9¢8 B 7.60 240548
CTRE Cocurt Heporter 03/20/9¢ B 61E.80 3683 237845 Burnham, Habal & Associates, 1; DEPC - KAY F.
EASCHN ; INVGICE
#11921;:02/24/98
UODT Photoooples D3/2379¢ E 4.80 239694
LU InTerast D3/26/0% B 211.35 2446782 thrw 03/26/9%
YA Far 03730758 B 2.0C 247557
Do Phocnonooies 04/01/9% 5 .80 248307
04702798 B .40 249737
04/06/9% B . oc 250851
04/07/98 E 2540 252369
0d/09/93 B TLEG 2603735
04/13/98 B 3,00 262436
G4/14/584 E .20 262834
Fa: 04/20/9¢8 B .60 26882¢
Fh.otocopies 04/2279¢ 5 540 Z270017
Otner Eillanle 04/723/98 =] 40,00 4142 277307  Jim C. Harris; Copiles of Documents; INVOICE
#0PEr-PRC;04/23/98
ZIN? Interesg 04/23/98 E 206.1% 272802 thrv 04/%23/9R
351 Other Hillable G4/23/98 B B41.50 4135 272233 Harris and Sutton; Trial Transcripts - Robinscr
vs. State F;INVOICE #4/1/98;04/01/98
oURY Photoccpies 04/23/98 B 6i.40 2724582



&she, Humohrey, Greener & Welsh, FLA. Page: t
Matter lLedger Report Rup : 11/11/9¢
From 01/01/8C thry 11/11/98

MATTER SHL Juaete Farm Tlass Acticn INIT. ATTY RHG: Richard H. Greenerx
BILL. ATTY RHG Richard H. Greener
RESP. ATTY RHG Richarc H. Greener
04/27/98 E 1L 20 275644
Fax 05/01/98 5 4.00 291433
TOF: Phntocoopiles 05/01/5¢F =} 0.40 283687
Fam 05/04/9¢ 3 5.00 291467
03/05/98 B 11.600 2BE073
05712/94 B Z.80 290844
15714758 E 0.4% 293306
05715/ 94 E 11.80 294901
05/18/9% B 815.380 295971
05/19/98 B 77,40 296600
ZINT Interest 05/25/58 B 208.15 298986 thrv 05/25/98
COF. Thotocopies 05/2¢6/5%4 B 34.60 303354
tXFE Eupert Fees/Witne 06/09/5& B 67.50 4614 317735 Wayne L. Soward;
;INVOICE #Hernandez;05/01/9&
CODY Photoooples 05/11/9€ B EL.60 318968
06/15758 B 15.2¢ 322595
06715798 B 304.80 32025949
CTER Tourt kReporter Oes19/9% =] 484.80 4747 324136 Burnham, Habel & Associates, I; Carter Depo
s INVOICE
#12382:05/28/98
0z Otrar Billable 06/19/9% B 45.00 4788 32436% TFrancis J. Dega, M.D.; Medical Records
; INWOICE #Rittenhouss;06/15/9%
G6/19/9% E 3C.00 4763 324244 Medical Center Physicians, F.A; Medical Records
; INVOIZE
fiRittenhouse; 06/19/98
06/26/088 E 3¢90 4763 32424€ Medical Center Physicians, P.A; Medical Records
; INVOICE #Dunn; 06/19/7 9%
TR Zoert Reporier SR YT E 305.2C 4747 324142 Barnham, habel § Associates, 1; Egan Depo

s INVCICE
#12380;06/01/98
OB Jtrhaer Billapie 06/29/98 B BOE.77 4749 324146 Capatcl Ceopy & Prant; Copies

;INVOICE #5/20/538,05/20/98

0Oy Frotococoples QG6/23/9¢ B 28.8C 328595
IINT Inreras: GOH/2E/ 58 E 323.79 330758 thru 06/25/9€
oE Otnsr Billable C6/25/788 E 35.00 4901 33053% Boise Chiropractic; Medical Records
JINVOICE #Dunn w. Nampa;06/17/9¢
06/25/9¢ B do. 27 4861 330281 KINKO's; Coples
; INVOICE #512200030274;06/11/5¢%
bo/Zz/9E 2] JL.e2 4881 3304%201 SBmart Corporation: Medical Records
;INVOICE kr0l07822:06/16/9%
06/25798 E 20.00 4457 330262 Idaho Pnysical Therapy; Medical Records
s INVOICE #Rittenhousa;0e/ig/ D
TR fan G7/01/9¢ E 2.00 349413
COTY Photoconies 07 /057495 53 G.20 342340
CEFL Zupert Fees/Witne 07/13/9% B 3Z.19 50758 345280 Wayne L. Doward:
; INVOICE #Hernande:z wv. 3u%;06/01/%8
! oroar Blilalbls 077,13/95 E 35.00 503% 345093 TFamily Medical Clinic, P.A.; Medical Recordsr -
Dunt: ;INVOICE f375362;06/14 79
; Eurary Teas/Witne 07/27/790 E -GZ50 4614 348764 Wayne L. Soward; ;INVOICE #Hernandecs;DS5/01/8n
07/37/ 8¢ E 62,00 5125 34847t Wayne L. Soward;



v, Greener & Welsh, F.A. Page: G
Matter Ledger Report Run @ 11/1.799
From C1/0i/80 thru 11/11/28

"= BEruce Z. 5kaug
MATTER OG1 Stzte Farm Clasg Acotion 21T, ATTY RHS  Richard H. Greener
BILL. ATTY RHG Richard H. Greener
EESF. ATTY RHG Richard E. Greener
; INVOICE #Bernandez;05/01/98
COFY Fhotcooples 07/21/98 E 2.00 353600
Fz.  Fau 07722/98 B .00 353347
07/23/93 B 35%.01 35508% thru 07/23/9%
Q7/24/98 E 1.00 365273
C7/2979% B 1.60 365410
TOEY PhioTocoples Cs/10/3¢E 5 21,48 368874
TR Faw UE/12/98 B 1.0C 370602
COFY Photocepies 05713798 E 2.40 371864
08/18/96 E .20 374667
PR Faw Qa/24/95 B 11.00 380036
ZINT Intersst OR/25/9% B 36C.10 380889 thra 08/25/98
F& Fax 0B/28/98 B 4.00 388024
09/22/98 B G.40 403657
09723798 B 24.40 405448
08/24/98 E 120,20 437870
iM% lnterest 098/24/98 E 360.71 407360 thro 09/24/98
05 Otner Biliavle 09/ z4/9¢ = 2e.0C 5965 40653.  ldaho Physicel Medicire & Reha: medicsl records
- Rittenhouse ; INVOICE
4Rittenhouse; 09/10/98
COUY Fhotoeopies 059/25/9% E 322,60 40963¢€
140/09/88 B Q.60 419619
10/15/98 El 3.00 425229
10/23/98 B S, 44 6344 428521 Lewis-Nexis; ;INVQICT $9809068009;09/30/95
10/25/98 B 363.34 429904 thru 10/25/9¢
10/28/94 E G4 .0C 99140 436797 Aas County Clerk of the Court; Copies

; INVOICE
#10/28/95;10/28/96

TUEL Tourt Repurter 11/1379¢% B §41.54 £541 444560 Patricia M Biaska, C5R; Stever Prater and Jim
Mathis ; IMVQICE #Robinson vs.
St;1L/53/98
COTY rhaeteceople 11/1379% =) .80 444861
ZIHT Irterest 11724798 B 368.31 452735 thru 11/24/9¢
Lo Long Distance 12717798 E .40 467716 11/13/98
COFY Fhotooeonies 12/22/9¢6 B 51.00 47017 11/25-12/21
Y107 Interest B 1p2. 43 472377 thru 12/22/9%
Tl FhsLscoples 5 32,20 18435%
5 TG 20 438546
[ = 385,24 494431 thru D1/24/9%8
CTRD Tt Reudrie: Ors0b 4 E 3ha .75 ta%6 S0G50%  Burnham, Habe! & Asscciates, I Depo oI L. Alan
West ; INVOICE
#13506:01/26/85
ZINT intevest D2/24/5%5% B 283.76 5184G1  thru D2/24/88
1%,011.2¢

14, 864,60
35,680, 86




Humphrey, Greener & Welsh, P.A. Page: Z
Matter Ledger Report Rur ; L1/1i/%¢
From 0L/01/80 thru 21/11/99

7g. State Farm INIT. ATTY RHG Richgrd H. Greener
BILL. ATTY RHG Richard H. Greener
RESF. ATTY RHC Richard H. Greener

Rizhard H. CGreene G£3/01/9% E u C.el 105.600 521972 Review Ltr from J. L& Rue re discovery, Ltr oo
LaRue in response

M. balair 03716/

e}

G E u 0,30 1.5 53480¢ Conferences with J.S5immons re: complaints an:z
consolidation of actions: review pleading filecs
and dockets to retrieve requested documents

Fichard rn. Greene 06/24/9¢ B G

2.1 1928

(8]
3
(=3}
o
w1l
o
(8
I

Conf N. Hpkins and <. Ekronberg; Memc to F
Carson re Documents, Review Matters for Status
Conference

06/28/99
06/29/90

07/.0/9%

i)
ol
[l

.30 52.50 608453 TC J. Larue, Memo to File
U C.7¢ 122.56 608507 TCJ. Larue, Prepare Dep Notices

e m

C 1.26 210.00C 61702% Research, Draft Motien te COmpel DIscovery,

Memo and Affidavit in Support

0%7/12/8¢

o
-
2]
28]
[
—
b
La2
o
o

617403 Review file; review memorandum from handlinc
attorney; review probate Iile; prepare and
araft Motion to Amend Substituting Estate as
party plaintiff; ARffidavit of Counsel; proposed
Order and proposed Fourth Amended Complainc;
several telephone calls Lo Judge Wilper's clzri
regarding scheduling hearing; prepare drafv of
Notice of Hearing; calls to asscoclate counsel

tc obrtain state bar numbers for nleadings.

Q7730098 E 8] 1.50 8z

S
w
=)
o
)
()
[
L
o

Conference with MN.Hopkins Garrett re:
preparatiorn of 30(b) (6} deposition notice;
review pleading files for prior depesition
notices and Hovember 19%F order re: 30(b} (G
depositions of defendants: prepare initial
draft of Notice of 30{b! (8) Deposition and
Duces Tecum Regquests with memc to N.Hopking
Garrett

O Richara BL Greens OBE/02/59 E il N

L
=3
o
1
-3
s
(]
[x)
[#35)
I}
her

o

Conf N. Hopkins, J. Simmons re Statwes Zont;

Scheduling; TC J» harxris, TC J» Krant:z

Do /03799 ] | o.an L2250 03400¢ Conf 3. Hopkins, work an 3Cbt
GE/04/79% E s 1.0 19,50 £37021 keview and set depositionsz - 20bt Review Lent
Netices; Coni N. Heopking

ot Tar LRl Baldlr Ga/0d4.799 E il Z.1c

=

112,50 £3813%  Conference with K.Hopkins Garrert

oI 30{pV16: cdeposition nobice; xe

depesition nctice; C[elephone gall
re: arrangements for depositicn 1n HloomingTomn,
I.; draft memc teo staff re: deposizion
scheduling, calendaring and reminders to maks:

travel arrangements ir Octoper 1999

=
i
m
=
I
]
o
e
gl
[s3
e
el
m

G33198 keview 3G I 6, Con{ M. Hopkins

64050° Conf{erence with P.Carson re: 30{p) (6}
deposition status; process deposition notlce
fer filing and service; drait memo re:

calendaring to 7, Edwards



Matter Ledger Repor: Rur

From G1/01/80 thre 11/11/89

S Bruce B. Skxauo

jese and Carmern Hernandec vs. 3tate farm INIT. ATTY RHG Richard H. Greener
BILL. ATTY RHG Eicharc H. Gresner

RESE. ATTY RHG Richard H. Greener

iz Fronberg 0D9/10/949 B U .30 31.50 67204¢ Review respenses ¢ discovery reguests.
Tapbie TROMDSOn 0%/14/99 3 0 0.3C 13,56 664513 LITIGATION Research correspondence re: RHG
request for status on Harris docs: draft e-mail

memc to RHG.

09/1479% g U .00 65.00 664905 Research pleadings for discovery from opposing
counsel 0.8; conference with Chris Kronberc

regarding Motion te Compel .2

Carolyn . Baldin 09/16/99 B i 0.2¢ 11.6C 66644c <Conference with R.Greener re: J.Harris
information reguest; review corresponcence file
for Harris lietter with memc tc P.Carson re:
information reguest Status

09/26/5¢4 E u C.10 5.50 574046 Telephone call with Set Depo re: cancellaticn
of Illincis depeositions

10/07/9% B U 6.0 .50 683204 Draft meme to P.Carson re:! inguiry cencerning
status of 10/2Z calendar entry

e Richard E. Greene 10/19/9% B U 0.9¢ 157.40 689394 Conf N. Hopkins, Work on Settiements Proposal

oT Debbie Thompson 11/08/99 B u LT 116.5C 717655 LITIGATION Draft medical specials summaries Ifor
Jose and Carman Hernandez.

WES Wyeatt E. Jonnson 11/1079% B 0 3.50 315.00 718610 HKesearcn and craft legal memorandum analyzing
potential settlement with regard to pending
ciass action.

11/10/9% B I 0.3¢C 27.00 718623 Finalize legal memorandum regarding Rule 23{e);

conference with Richard Greenar.
= ILLABLE Z,487 .00
O -BILLABLE G.a¢ G.on
SUPPRESEAEBLE [N 0.oc
TOTAL I,487.00C
——————————————————————————————————————————————————————————— < FEWMZC

I DATE 5TS S WALUL
b 1 C12s 29014790 Al 1.50
00/1gs80 i 0.1c¢
AUYALCED C.0o
o= CESH i.60
TTA L. 6L



LrAnG, Hamonrey, Sreener L Welsh, FLOA.

Fage 1
Matter Ledger Repor: Run @ 11/11.49¢
From 01/01/80 thru 11/11/90
TLTENT (4455 Bruce B, Skaug
MITTER G Lirdz and Michasel Rittenhouse vs. State Farm INIT. ATTY RHG Richard H. Greener

BILL. ATTY RRG Richard H. Greener

RESEF, ATTY RHG Richard H. Sreener

TEDOAME DATE CODE 5TS HOURS I VALUE TASE REY & TEXT
T Tnris kronberg 07/729/98 E L 1,40 147.0C £29750 Review file in preparatiorn for scheduling

conference; attenc schedulling conIgrence wii’
NJhH.

BILLAELE 1.40 147,048
NON-BILLAELE 0.0¢ o.od
SUFFRESSAELE G.0C G.o0
TOTAL 1.4¢0 147.00



-
<, Mumphrsy, Greener § Welish, F.A&. Page: i
Matter Ledger Report Run 11717 744
From 01/01/8C thru 1i/11/953
vs. Stane Farm TNIT. ATTY RHG Richard K. Gresner
EILL. ATTY REC ichard E. Greener
RESP. ATTY RHC Richard E. Greener
--------------------------------------------------------------- o A T ——— —————-—
TLDE MAME DATE CCDE 3TE& HOURZE 5 VALUL TESH RET #  TEXT
J5 SOor 31rmens 03/13/9¢ B 1 ¢.30 27.00 53980¢€ Cenierence with RHG.
03/16/9¢% B [y J.60 54.00 54097 File review re RICO; drafc lettsr to G.
Goichochea.
Ou/02/9% E L C.a0 55.00 643273 Conference with RHG; conference with NJE.
BIT.ARELE 1.50 135,00
MOr-81LLABLE c.ae 0.00
SIPPREZSABLE 0.0¢ 0.00
TGTAL I.5¢C 135.00
———————————————————————————————————————————————————— EILLETD EXFEN E Sr—mm e e
JCDE MAME DATE 3T S VALUE CK RET # TEXT
01/11/96 E C.80G 1154980
04,2797 E G.4An le43tg
0.00

[
o

=
N
oo



Zashc, Humohrey, Greener & Welsh, ©.4, Fage: 1
Matter Leadger Report Run : 11/11/8%
From 01/01/80 thru 11/11/99

Eruce 2. Skaug

Jont. Stirm wve. State Fanm INIT. ATTY RHG Richard H. Greener
BILL. ATTY RHG Richard H. Greener
RESP. ATTY RHG Richard H. Greener

———————————————————————————————————————————————————— ETLLED EY¥ FENGE L Sommrmmm oo oo oo
CODE HREMEZ ATE STE 5 VALUEL CK % REF # TEXT
FRE 01/25/9¢ E 76.80 117012 Previous Baiance

0.00
76.80
76,80




SrEh, Rumpnrsy, Zreener 4 1, FL.E. Page: 1
Matter Ledger keport Run : 11/11./49%
From 01/01/8C thru 11/11/9%4

State Farm INIT. ATTY RHG Richard i. Greener

BILL. ATTY RHG Richard H. Greener

RESP. ATTY RHG Richard H. Greener
—————————————————————————————————————————————————— EILLlETL S X P LN 3 FE S e e

TR DATE STS $ YALUZ Ck # REF # TEXT
k - i7uE Bal d1/2576¢ B 60. 85 214407 Previous Halance

60.65
TOTAL 60.Go




Lesns, Humphrey, Greener & Welsh, FLA. Page: H
Matter Ledaer Repor: Burn o 117117949
From 01/01/B0 thru 131/11/89

Heuvel vs. State INIT. ATTY RHG Richard E. Greener
BILL. ATTY RHG Ricnard H. Greener
RESF. ATTY REKCGC Richard H. Greener

———————————————————————————————————————————————————— EIL_ETL EX P EMNGEE Gromrmmmmr e e
ol MAME DATE STE S VALUEL C¥ # REF # TEXT

z 01/25/9¢ B 135.91 117013 Previcus Balance

Fhotocopies 03/27/96 B 0.20 162428
fal = Other Eillable 0c/04/97 B 42.7¢C 166860 Bill #1760; Statenouse Inn; lodging for

depositon/G. Vanden

ADWRNZED 82.7C

O - CASH 13e.11

TOTAL 218,82



o Welsh, 2.4

o
1%
i
in
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o
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Zesho, Humgnrey,

Matrer Ledoger KReport

“rom 0:/01/80 thruv 11/11/9¢

Page: z

Ran : 11/12/9%9

IlIT. ATTY RHZ Richard H. Greenar
BEILL. ATTY RHZ Richard H. Gresner
RES®. ATTY RHG Richard H. Greener

SDVANCZED

HOH-CASH

TOTAL

] LLED E
& WALUE

108.72

5.10

G.Q0

117.82

117.82

117014
1176ld

TEXT

frevious Balance




