DAVID E, RAYBORN
Rayborn Law Office

P. 0. Box 1

Pocatello, ID 83204-0001
(208) 233-3914

Idaho State Bar #3308

Attorney for R. Sam Hopkins, Chapter 7 Trustee

IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE DISTRICT QF IDAHO

In re: )
) Case No. 99-41879
VLADIMIR PANIQUCHKINE )
TATYANA PANIOUCHKINE, ) APPLICATION FOR ATTORNEY
) FEES AND COSTS
Debtors. )

DAVID E. RAYBORN, attorney for R. Sam Hopkins, Trustee, makes application to the
Court for the payment of attorney fees in the reduced sum of $500.00. Counsel respeétfully
informs the Court as follows:
L.
Narrative Summary
A Background
1 The Petition was filed November 15, 1999,
2} The Order Approving Employment of Counsel was entered by this Court
on June 26, 2000, and counsel provided services to the Trustee beginning May 18,
2000. Counsel is requesting compensation pursuant to 11 U.8.C. §503(h).
3) Counsel was employed by the Trustee on the following terms and
conditions:
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herein:

C.

a. No previous payments have been made.
b, The source of compensation to be paid is from the Debtor’s estate.
C. No retainer was paid.

4) Application for Professional Fees. David E. Rayborn is requesting fees at
the rate of $100.00 per hour.

)] This is a final application.

6) This application covers legal services rendered for the period covering May
18, 2000, through August 7, 2001,

Case Status.

1) Funds on hand in the estate: $2,282.03.

2) Summary of Administration: The estate has been fully administered and is
ready to close,

Project Summary. Following is a summary of the work completed by Applicant

1) General review of Petition and Schedules;

2) Counseling with client and recovery of property of the estate;

3 Review information on State court action: Paniouchkine vs. Hutchinson.
Evaluation Standards; See Exhibit "A".

Certification. Applicant certifies that R. Sam Hopkins has reviewed this fee

application and has approved the same,
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IL.
Itemization of Service Rendered
A. See Exhibit "A",
MI.
Reimbursement of Actual Necessary Expenses
Applicant requests reimbursement of actual necessary expenses in the sum of $13.61, as
is detailed on Exhibit "A" attached hereto.

DATED this | b'%y of December, 2001,

Ml

DAVID E. RAYBD
Attorney for Chapter 7 Trustee

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

I HEREBY CERTIFY that on the ! 3 Q:Ify of December, 2001, 1 served a true and
correct copy of this document upon the following, by the method indicated:

Jay D. Sudweeks [X] U.§. Mail

May, Sudweeks & Browning [] Hand Delivery

P. O. Box 1846 [] Facsimile

Twin Falls, ID 83303-1846 [] Courthouse Mail Box
Vladimir Paniouchkine [X] U. 5. Mail

Tatyana Paniouchkine [] Hand Delivery

904 Acacia Avenue [] Facsimile

Glendale, CA 91205 [] Courthouse Mail Box
R. Sam Hopkins [X] U.S. Mail

Chapter 7 Bankruptcy Trustee [1 Hand Delivery

P. O. Box 3014 [1 Facsimile

Pocatello, ID 83204-3014 [1 Courthouse Mail Box

D1t —

DAVID E. RAYBORN
Attorney for Chapter 7 Trustee
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EXHIBIT "A"

December 12, 2001

R. Sam Hopkins

Trustree

836 East Center Street, Suite C
P. O. Box 3014
Pocatello, ID 83206-3014

Re:

05/18/00

05/25/00

06/01/00

06/02/00

06/20/00

06/21/00

07/03/00

07/11/00

07/11/00

07/11/00

Vladimir & Tatyana Paniouchkine/Case No. 99-41879
Conference w/Mr. Hopkins and review file (1.0 hours)

Draft Application for Leave to Retain Attorney and proposed
Order Authorizing Employment of Counsel (0.5 hours)

Postage expense on Application and Order Authorizing
Employment

Telephone conference w/Jeff Hepworth (counsel in debtors’
State court action vs. Hutchinson (0.25 hours)

Status conference w/trustee; arrangements for intervention
in State court action (1.0 hours)

Draft Motion to Intervene and Complaint in Intervention
(1.5 hours)

Prepare for court; conference court on Motion to Intervene
(1.0 hours)

Draft Order Granting Intervention; letter to Clerk of Court
{0.75 hours)

Postage expense

Draft Motion for Turnover of Information (0,75 hours)

$100.00

$ 50.00
$ 2.97
$25.00
$100.00
$150.00
$100.00
$75.00

$ 2.53

$75.00



R.. Sam Hopkins

Trustee
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07/11/00
08/09/00
08/09/00
08/09/00
08/09/00

08/10/00

08/21/00

08/21/00
08/21/00
09/20/00

09/28/00

09/28/00

10/23/00

01/11/01

01/11/01
03/02/01

03/02/01

Postage expense

Court on Motion for Turnover of Information (0.75 hours)
Draft Order for Turnover of Information (0.5 hours)
Postage expense

Draft Motion for 2004 Exam of Debtors (0.5 hours)

Telephone conference w/trustee re: 2004 4exam; general case
review (0.5 hours)

Case review; letter to client; draft Summons and Certificate of
Service on Complaint jn Intervention (1.0 hours)

Letter to Clerk of State Court (0.25 hours)
Postage expense
Conference w/trustee re: case planning (0.5 hours)

Telephone conference w/Mr. Hepworth (re: intervention claim)
(0.25 hours)

Telephone conference w/trustee re: Paniouchkine case
(0.25 hours)

Telephone conference w/Mr. Hepworth re; settlement
(0.25 hours)

Review and examine Stipulation and Order for Dismissal of
Paniouchkine v. Hutchinson; forward same to court (0.25 hours)

Postage expense
Letter to Mr. Sudweeks re: accounts receivable (0.4 hours)

Postage expense

$ 0.99
$75.00
$50.00
$ 099
$50.00

$25.00

$100.00

$25.00
$ 1.21
$ 50.00

$25.00

$25.00

$25.00

$25.00

$ 0.76
$ 40.00

$ 0.68
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03/30/01

03/30/01

04/16/01

04/16/01

06/21/01

06/26/01
06/26/01
08/07/01
08/07/01
12/12/01

12/12/01

12/12/01

12/12/01
Thank you.

DER/sls

Letter to Mr. Hopkins; letter to Mr. Sudweeks re: accounts
receivable; review correspondence from Mr. Sudweeks re;
same (1.2 hours)

Postage expense

Review requested documentation received from debtors; letter
to debtors’ counsel requesting additional documentation

(0.5 hours)

Postage expense

Telephone conferences w/Mr. Hopkins re: SYSTANS
receivables (0.1 hours)

Draft Motion for Turnover of Information (0.3 hours)
Postage expense

Letter to SYSTRAN Financial (0.3 hours)

Postage expense

Total attorney fees:

Total costs:

Combined total:

Total Requested:

Attorney’s fees:
Costs;

COMBINED REQUESTED TOTAL

$120.00

$ 1.10

$ 50.00

$ 0.68

$10.00

$30.00
$1.02
$ 30.00
$ 0.68
$1,430.00

13.61

$1,443 61

$500.00
$.13.61

$513.61



