

Laura E. Burri
RINGERT CLARK CHARTERED
455 South Third, P.O. Box 2773
Boise, Idaho 83701-2773
Telephone No. (208) 342-4591
Idaho State Bar No. 3573

U.S. DISTRICT COURT
DISTRICT OF IDAHO
BOISE, IDAHO
CLERK

Attorneys for Debtors

IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE DISTRICT OF IDAHO

In re:)	
)	Case No. 93-02385
DAVE SILVA, dba Nos Otros, Inc., and)	
SHARON SELMASSKA, dba,)	REQUEST FOR ALLOWANCE OF
S and S Cleaning,)	COMPENSATION BY ATTORNEYS
Debtors.)	FOR DEBTORS
_____)

COMES NOW Ringert Clark Chartered, Attorneys at Law, (hereinafter "Applicant") and pursuant to 11 U.S.C. §330 and 331, moves the Court for an Order authorizing and directing payment of attorneys' fees in the amount of \$8,327.00 as further set forth in the attachments hereto. This motion is made on the following grounds:

1. In the case of *In re Century Cleaning Service, Inc.*, 195 F.3d 1053 (9th Cir. 1999), the Ninth Circuit ruled that a debtor's attorney can seek compensation for post-petition legal services from property of the estate.

2. Applicant, Ringert Clark Chartered has acted as counsel for the debtors throughout the bankruptcy proceeding. This representation has included, in part, providing and assisting the trustee and his counsel as to assets of the estate and objecting to claims. Specifically, applicant was able to provide the trustee information and assistance pertaining the bank account in New Jersey. The trustee has subsequently obtained a judgement pertaining to this bank account which funds are now the sole asset of the estate. Applicant also assisted the trustee as to claims filed by creditors. Objections to these claims filed by applicant were

127

successfully prosecuted by applicant. In addition, applicant assisted the trustee as to the California action and the proceedings undertaken by the trustee to obtain assets claimed by the debtor in California.

3. The time entries of applicant that are of direct benefit to the estate are attached hereto. Applicant has not included in this fee request any time entries that were of benefit only to the debtor personally. Fees are not requested as to the adversary action filed against the debtor for nondischargeability. The fees requested here have been edited to include only the time entries of applicant that were of benefit to the estate.

DATED this 28th day of March, 2000.

RINGERT CLARK CHARTERED,

by Laura E. Burri
Laura E. Burri
Attorneys for Unsecured Creditors Committee

Exhibit "A"
INFORMATION FOR UNITED STATES TRUSTEE'S
FEE AND EXPENSE GUIDELINES

I. INFORMATION ABOUT THE APPLICANT AND APPLICATION.

1.	Date the bankruptcy petitions were filed:	August 13, 1993
	Date the application requesting approval of employment was filed:	NA
	Date the order approving employment of applicant was signed:	NA
	Identify of the party represented in this case:	Debtors
	If applicant seeking compensation under a provision of the Bankruptcy Code other than Section 330, state which section:	N/A
2.	Terms and conditions of employment and compensation:	\$80.00 to \$115.00 per hour
	Source of compensation:	Bankruptcy Estate
	Identify the existence and terms controlling the use of any retainer :	N/A
	Identify any budgetary or other limitations on fees:	N/A
3.	Names and hourly rates of applicant's professionals and paraprofessionals who are requesting compensation:	Laura E. Burri \$80.00 to \$115.00/hour
	Explanation of any changes in hourly rates:	Hourly rates increased with time and experience during the course of the case
	Is the requested compensation based on the customary compensation charged by comparably skilled practitioners in cases other than cases under Title 11?	Yes

II. CASE STATUS.

A.	Amount of cash on hand or in deposit in the estate.	Approximately \$76,102.55
B.	Amount and nature of accrued unpaid administrative expenses (include trustee fees and expenses, if applicable).	There are accrued and unpaid administrative expenses of the following: Barry Peters and possibly and accountant for the Trustee. Total administrative expenses do not exceed cash on hand.
C.	The amount of unencumbered funds in the estate.	Approximately \$76,102.55 , cash on hand.
D.	Operating profit or loss, if applicable.	N/A
E.	If a chapter 7 case then identify exhibit which contains summary of the administration of the case, including estimated case closure date and if requested, feasibility of interim payment.	N/A
F.	If a chapter 11 case, when was disclosure statement and plan been filed and have quarterly fees and monthly financial reports been paid or filed.	N/A

II PROJECT SUMMARY.

Identify each discrete project or task for which compensation or reimbursement of expenses is sought. Each project itemization must include, on a separate attachment:

See attached Exhibits B and C.

- a. Description of the project, its necessity and benefit to the estate and the status of the project.
- b. Identification of each person providing billable services on the project.
- c. A statement of the number of hours spent and amount of compensation requested for each professional for each project.
- d. Itemized time and service entries including chronologically listing the date of service, description of service and time spent providing service.

"EXHIBIT B:"

Project Categories
David Silva and Sharon Selmasska

Category	Category Number	Total
<u>ASSET ANALYSIS AND RECOVERY:</u>	201	\$8,327.00
<u>ASSET DISPOSITION:</u>	202	
<u>BUSINESS OPERATIONS:</u>	203	
<u>CASE ADMINISTRATION:</u>	204	
<u>CLAIMS ADMINISTRATION AND OBJECTIONS:</u>	205	
<u>EMPLOYEE BENEFITS/PENSIONS:</u>	206	
<u>FEE/EMPLOYMENT APPLICATIONS:</u>	207	
<u>FEE/EMPLOYMENT OBJECTIONS:</u>	208	
<u>FINANCING:</u>	209	
<u>LITIGATION:</u>	210	
<u>MEETING OF CREDITORS:</u>	211	
<u>PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT:</u>	212	
<u>RELIEF FROM STAY PROCEEDINGS:</u>	213	
<u>ACCOUNTING/AUDITING:</u>	214	
<u>BUSINESS ANALYSIS:</u>	215	
<u>CORPORATE FINANCE:</u>	216	
<u>DATA ANALYSIS:</u>	217	
<u>LITIGATION CONSULTING:</u>	218	
<u>RECONSTRUCTION ACCOUNTING:</u>	219	
<u>TAX ISSUES:</u>	220	
<u>VALUATION:</u>	221	
<u>TOTAL:</u>		<u>\$8,327.00</u>

SUMMARY SHEET
EXHIBIT C
David Silva and Sharon Selmasska

Fees previously requested:	\$	0.00		
Fees previously awarded:	\$	0.00		
Expenses previously requested:	\$	0.00		
Expenses previously awarded:	\$	0.00		
Total retainer paid:	\$	0.00		CURRENT APPLICATION:
Current retainer balance:	\$	0.00		Fees requested: \$ 8,327.00
				Expenses requested: \$ 0.00
				Total requested: \$18,749.31

BILLING INFORMATION

NAME OF PROFESSIONALS	YEAR OF BAR ADMISSION	HOURS BILLED	BILLING RATE	TOTAL FOR APPLICATION
-----------------------	-----------------------	--------------	--------------	-----------------------

PARTNERS:

Laura E. Burri	1986	89.10	\$85.00- \$115.00	\$8,327.00
----------------	------	-------	-------------------	------------

ASSOCIATE:

PARAPROFESSIONALS:

Total		89.10		\$ 8,327.00
--------------	--	--------------	--	--------------------

TOTAL BLENDED HOURLY RATE: \$100.00

DETAIL FEE TRANSACTION FILE LIST
Ringert Clark Chartered
David Silva and Sharon Selmasska

<u>Date</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>	<u>Description</u>
11/30/93	\$85.00	.60	\$51.00	Telephone conferences with First Fidelity Bank and Rob Farrear
12/30/93	\$85.00	.20	\$17.00	Letter to First Fidelity Bank on bank account
01/19/83	\$85.00	.20	\$17.00	Telephone conference with trustee's office
01/20/93	\$85.00	.40	\$34.00	Letter to trustee's office on bank account
03/25/94	\$90.00	.20	\$18.00	Telephone conference with B. Peters on New Jersey Bank account
04/18/94	\$90.00	.30	\$27.00	Office conference with B. Peters and client on Wussler claim
04/19/84	\$90.00	1.70	\$153.00	Telephone conference with Sharon, Dave and B. Peters, Office conference with Dave, Sharon, B. Peters and B. Zimmerman
04/27/94	\$90.00	1.90	\$171.00	Office conference with Dave, Telephone conferences with D. Rinaldo, B. Peters on California matters, telephone conferences with B. Peters and Dave
05/05/94	\$90.00	.30	\$27.00	Preparation of fax to Rinaldo and Peters
05/09/94	\$90.00	.20	\$18.00	Telephone conference with Peters

06/28/94	\$90.00	3.50	\$315.00	Hearing on Motion to appoint special counsel for trustee; Review of Response and affidavit objecting to appointment of special counsel; Office conference with Dave, telephone conference with Vreeland
07/28/94	\$90.00	.30	\$27.00	Review of decision of court appointing special counsel; letter to client
01/23/95	\$90.00	.50	\$45.00	Telephone conferences with Peters and Dave; Preparation of fax to Peters on California action
02/03/95	\$90.00	1.00	\$90.00	Review of Memorandum of Decision and Order; Preparation of fax to Vreeland; Telephone conferences with B. Peters and Dave
02/10/95	\$90.00	1.00	\$90.00	Telephone conference with Vreeland; Review of letter on dates; Preparation of fax to Vreeland
02/24/95	\$90.00	.20	\$18.00	Review of letter from Vreeland
04/26/95	\$90.00	.20	\$18.00	Telephone conference with Dave
05/09/95	\$90.00	.20	\$18.00	Telephone conference with Vreeland
05/19/95	\$90.00	.10	\$ 9.00	Telephone conference with B. Peters On case status
06/30/95	\$90.00	.20	\$18.00	Review of letter from Vreeland
07/03/95	\$90.00	.10	\$ 9.00	Review of letter from Vreeland
07/10/95	\$90.00	.50	\$45.00	Preparation of notes for status conference; Telephone conference with B. Peters
07/18/95	\$90.00	.40	\$36.00	Telephone conference with B. Peters; Preparation of letter to McQuarter with creditors list

07/26/95	\$90.00	.10	\$ 9.00	Telephone conference with Dave on renewal of Judgment
09/19/95	\$90.00	.50	\$45.00	Hearing on employment of California Counsel; Letter to Dave
10/18/95	\$125.00	.30	\$37.50	Hearing - status conference
11/17/95	\$90.00	.20	\$18.00	Telephone conference with K. McCorder on California action
12/14/95	\$90.00	.60	\$54.00	Conference call on status of California action; Letter to client
12/15/95	\$90.00	.20	\$18.00	Review of Kendrick Affidavit; Telephone conference with B. Peters
01/03/96	\$90.00	.40	\$36.00	Letter to P. Noack; Preparation of Satisfaction of Judgment
01/08/96	\$90.00	.10	\$ 9.00	Telephone conference with B. Peters On conference call results
01/09/96	\$90.00	.50	\$45.00	Review of documents received from B. Peters as to California action and status conference
01/09/96	\$90.00	.20	\$18.00	Telephone conference with Vreeland
01/10/96	\$90.00	.50	\$45.00	Conference call on scheduling; Letter to Dave
02/3/96	\$90.00	.20	\$18.00	Telephone conference with K. McQuarter
02/14/96	\$90.00	.10	\$9.00	Telephone conference with B. Peters On McQuarter fees
03/05/96	\$90.00	.20	\$18.00	Telephone conference with Dave on copies of schedules to Vreeland
03/27/96	\$90.00	.20	\$18.00	Review of fax received from B. Vreeland

03/28/96	\$90.00	.20	\$18.00	Telephone conference with B. Vreeland on California proceeding
03/29/96	\$90.00	1.0	\$90.00	Review of file on conference with Kondrick in September 1994; Preparation of Affidavit for California proceeding; Preparation Of fax to B. Vreeland
05/01/96	\$90.00	.10	\$ 9.00	Review of status report prepared by Vreeland on California action
06/07/96	\$90.00	.70	\$63.00	Review of status of Idaho suit and options in California; Letter to Dave
07/31/96	\$90.00	.20	\$18.00	Telephone conference with Dave; Preparation of fax to Vreeland
09/03/96	\$90.00	.30	\$27.00	Review of Substitution documents for change in California Counsel and amended status report
09/19/96	\$90.00	.20	\$18.00	Telephone conference with David on California proceedings
09/26/96	\$90.00	.20	\$18.00	Telephone conference with C. Richmond on appointment as California counsel
10/02/96	\$90.00	.60	\$54.00	Hearing on application to appoint new California Counsel; Letter to Client
10/10/96	\$90.00	.20	\$18.00	Telephone conference with J. Krommenhoek on client proceedings
10/15/96	\$90.00	.70	\$63.00	Review of Cross-Complaint against Trustees and attorneys personally in California action
10/28/96	\$90.00	.40	\$36.00	Telephone conference with Kondrick; Letter to Vreeland, Peters and Richmond

11/01/96	\$90.00	.30	\$27.00	Telephone conference with J. Krommenhoek on California suit status
11/14/96	\$90.00	.30	\$27.00	Review of letter from Vreeland on resolution of Cross-Complaint; Preparation of reply letter to Kondrick
11/19/96	\$90.00	.20	\$18.00	Review of letter from B. Peters on status conference; Telephone conference with B. Peters office on location
12/02/96	\$90.00	.20	\$18.00	Telephone conference with Dave on current development
12/06/96	\$90.00	.10	\$ 9.00	Review of letter from Olofsen on California court status
12/10/96	\$90.00	.70	\$63.00	Status conference on adversary action in California
01/17/96	\$90.00	.20	\$18.00	Telephone conference with client on expiration of judgment
01/31/97	\$90.00	.40	\$36.00	Telephone conference with Vreeland and client on possible bankruptcy Motion on renewal of judgment in California
02/18/97	\$90.00	.40	\$36.00	Telephone conference with Court Clerk on motion to withdraw on Richmond; Telephone conferences with B. Peters and C. Richmond
02/18/97	\$90.00	.40	\$36.00	Telephone conference with Richmond, B. Peters, J. Olfson on status of California proceedings
02/19/97	\$90.00	.80	\$72.00	Conference call on Motion to Withdraw as Counsel by Richmond; Letter to client

02/19/97	\$90.00	.30	\$27.00	Review of letter from J. Olofson; Letter to client
03/03/97	\$90.00	.30	\$27.00	Telephone conference with J. Krommenhoek and client on meeting
03/04/97	\$90.00	1.50	\$135.00	Outside conference with client. B. Peters and J. Krommenhoek on status of California suit and Richmond as local counsel
03/06/97	\$90.00	.20	\$18.00	Review of letter from C. Richmond on withdrawal as counsel
03/07/97	\$90.00	.10	\$ 9.00	Letter to client on Richmond withdrawal
03/10/97	\$90.00	.20	\$18.00	Review of letter from J. Olofson; Letter to client as to status of Counsel
03/13/97	\$90.00	.20	\$18.00	Review of letter from Vreeland on change in California counsel; letter to client
03/25/97	\$90.00	.20	\$18.00	Outside conference with J. Krommenhoek on current status of proceedings
03/25/97	\$90.00	.20	\$18.00	Review of letter from J. Olofson on status of California matter; letter to client
03/31/97	\$90.00	.30	\$27.00	Telephone conferences with B. Peters, J. Krommenhoek, and client on client status options
03/31/97	\$90.00	.30	\$27.00	Telephone conference with client on trustee settlement proposal; Telephone conference with B. Peters
04/04/97	\$90.00	.20	\$18.00	Telephone conference with J. Olofson on status of California suit

04/03/97	\$90.00	.20	\$18.00	Letter to B. Peters and J. Krommenhoek on settlement
04/08/97	\$90.00	.10	\$ 9.00	Telephone conference with D. Silva on current status
04/10/97	\$90.00	.40	\$36.00	Telephone conference with B. Peters and B. Vreeland on local counsel
04/22/97	\$90.00	.20	\$18.00	Telephone conference with B. Peters On Milano check
04/28/97	\$90.00	.90	\$81.00	Review of fax from Bob Vreeland on California Judgment renewal issues; letter to B. Peters on renewal; review of files for Laura Burri letters to N.J. Bank; Letter to B. Peters with N.J. Bank letters
04/30/97	\$90.00	.10	\$ 9.00	Review of letter from B. Peters on possible Wussler sanction in Idaho
05/01/97	\$90.00	.30	\$27.00	Telephone conference with J. Krommenhoek on latest motions, up coming hearing on sanctions
05/01/97	\$90.00	1.80	\$162.00	Telephone conference with B. Vreeland; Review of motion and documents for stay violation by Olofson
05/05/97	\$90.00	.20	\$18.00	Review of fax from Kondrick on settlement proposal in California suit
05/06/97	\$90.00	.20	\$18.00	Review of J. Olofson fax on stay hearing and motion by N.J. counsel to appear in California proceeding
05/08/97	\$90.00	.30	\$27.00	Review of Pleadings for and against Motion to Continue Hearing on Sanctions
05/14/97	\$90.00	.90	\$81.00	Hearing on appointment of new counsel; Letter to client

05/16/97	\$90.00	.20	\$18.00	Telephone conference with B. Peters and client on depositions
05/19/97	\$90.00	1.0	\$90.00	Telephone conference with Dave and B. Peters on depositions; Review of Documents received from Kondrick on motions; Letter to B. Peters on Depositions
05/22/97	\$90.00	.50	\$45.00	Telephone conferences with Barbato and Dave on depositions
05/22/97	\$90.00	1.0	\$90.00	Telephone conference with J. Krommenhoek on pre-hearing meeting and with D. Silva on depositions, M. Barbato, B. Peters, and P. Kondrick on depositions and meeting
05/23/97	\$90.00	.40	\$36.00	Telephone conference with J. Krommenhoek and M. Barbato on California action.
05/28/97	\$90.00	.20	\$18.00	Telephone conference with B. Peters on status of pending matters
05/28/97	\$90.00	.20	\$18.00	Telephone conference with Dave on status
05/29/97	\$90.00	4.50	\$405.00	Telephone conference with client, Vreeland, and Rinaldo; Hearing on Motions for violation of stay and Motion to clarify
06/06/97	\$90.00	.40	\$36.00	Telephone conference with Dave and Art Sloan on appearance by Dave in California suit
06/09/97	\$90.00	.30	\$27.00	Telephone conference with Art Sloan B. Peters and D. Silva on status Of California suit
06/10/97	\$90.00	.30	\$27.00	Telephone conferences with B. Peters and client on status of Sloan representation

06/10/97	\$90.00	.40	\$36.00	Conference call with Jill Olofson, J. Krommenhoek, and B. Peters on settlement options
06/10/97	\$90.00	.30	\$27.00	Telephone conference with D. Silva and J. Olofson on settlement
06/11/97	\$90.00	.30	\$27.00	Telephone conference with B. Peters and client on Milano and N.J. Bank
06/11/97	\$90.00	.30	\$27.00	Telephone conference with J. Krommenhoek and B. Peters on abandonment and compromise of California action
06/17/97	\$90.00	.30	\$27.00	Review of fax from B. Peters on settlement of California suit; Telephone conferences with client and B. Peters
06/17/97	\$90.00	.40	\$36.00	Review of fax from B. Peters; Telephone conference with client; Preparation of fax to B. Peters
06/23/97	\$90.00	.30	\$27.00	Review of Barbato's memo in opposition to Summary Judgment in California
07/07/97	\$90.00	.30	\$27.00	Review of California tentative ruling on Summary Judgment
07/15/97	\$90.00	.20	\$18.00	Telephone conference with J. Krommenhoek on settlement conference options
08/04/97	\$90.00	.40	\$36.00	Review of courts decision on stay violation by Wussler; Letter to client
08/11/97	\$90.00	.50	\$45.00	Review of Kondrick Motion for Clarification; Letter to client; Telephone conference with J. Krommenhoek

08/12/97	\$90.00	.30	\$27.00	Review of Motions filed by trustee as to Wussler's failure to dismiss Trustee
08/12/97	\$90.00	.20	\$18.00	Telephone conference with J. Krommenhoek on objection to claims
08/13/97	\$90.00	.20	\$18.00	Telephone conference with J. Krommenhoek on claims
08/14/97	\$90.00	.20	\$18.00	Telephone conference with B. Peters on N.J. Judgment
08/14/97	\$90.00	.90	\$81.00	Preparation of Objection to Claims of Jensen and Pull
08/18/97	\$90.00	1.0	\$90.00	Office conference with D. Silva on status of actions; Peters Affidavit; Telephone conference with B. Peters Review of Affidavits
08/27/97	\$90.00	.20	\$18.00	Review of Kondrick Response to Trustee's motion
09/09/97	\$90.00	1.0	\$90.00	Hearing on trustee's Motion for Injunction and Wussler Motion to Clarify
09/29/97	\$90.00	.30	\$27.00	Telephone conference with Dave as to claims objections; Preparation for hearing on claims objections
09/30/97	\$90.00	.30	\$27.00	Review of Notice of Appeal by Wussler on decision as to trustee's role; Letter to client
10/01/97	\$90.00	2.0	\$180.00	Hearing on Objection to Claims; Letter-Order on Claims; Telephone conference with B. Peters and J. Olofson on appeal issues as to Trustee decision
10/07/97	\$90.00	.30	\$27.00	Review of Wussler issues on appeal; Letter to client

10/17/97	\$90.00	.40	\$36.00	Review of decision and order on First Fidelity Bank judgment; Letter to client
10/17/97	\$90.00	.40	\$36.00	Outside conference with J. Krommenhoek on settlement options on Wussler suit
10/20/97	\$90.00	.50	\$45.00	Telephone conference with client on California settlement conference; Telephone conference with J. Olofson
10/21/97	\$90.00	.30	\$27.00	Telephone conference with client on settlement conference
10/22/97	\$90.00	.20	\$18.00	Telephone conference with B. Peters on settlement proposal
10/24/97	\$90.00	.30	\$27.00	Letter to client on N.J. Bank appeal and possible abandonment
10/29/97	\$90.00	.60	\$54.00	Telephone conference with Dave and B. Peters on settlement offer; Telephone conference with B. Vreeland on judgment issues
11/04/97	\$90.00	.20	\$18.00	Telephone conference with J. Olofson as to settlement options
11/01/97	\$90.00	.20	\$18.00	Telephone conference with J. Krommenhoek on settlement conference
11/10/97	\$90.00	.20	\$18.00	Telephone conference with B. Peters on abandonment
11/12/97	\$90.00	.20	\$18.00	Telephone conference with J. Krommenhoek on abandonment
11/26/97	\$90.00	.30	\$27.00	Review of proposed abandonment By trustee to California action
12/08/97	\$90.00	.30	\$27.00	Telephone conference with Dave as to abandonment issues

12/10/97	\$90.00	1.20	\$108.00	Hearing trustee's Motion to Abandon Letter to client
01/13/98	\$100.00	.40	\$40.00	Telephone conference with Dave and B. Peters on status of trustee position on suit and bank appeal
01/15/98	\$100.00	.20	\$20.00	Telephone conference with B. Peters and D. Silva on sale of estate's interest
01/20/98	\$100.00	.30	\$30.00	Telephone conference with Dave; Letter to B. Peters on proposed sale of cause of action
02/23/98	\$100.00	.20	\$20.00	Telephone conference with Dave on status of California suit and Idaho Discovery
03/17/98	\$100.00	.20	\$20.00	Telephone conference with B. Peters on latest settlement
03/17/98	\$100.00	.70	\$70.00	Telephone conference with B. Peters Review of proposed trustee settlement; Telephone conference with client; Preparation of fax to B. Peters
03/17/98	\$100.00	.20	\$20.00	Telephone conference with M. Barbato on proposed settlement
03/23/98	\$100.00	.40	\$40.00	Review of fax from B. Peters; Telephone conference with M. Barbato
04/08/98	\$100.00	.30	\$30.00	Review of trustee's Motion to Compromise and Sale; Letter to client
04/09/98	\$100.00	.30	\$30.00	Research on trustee's sale of interest of estate in California action
04/15/98	\$85.00	1.80	\$153.00	Research at law library re issue of severability of right to cause of action between debtor and trustee

04/21/98	\$85.00	1.90	\$161.50	Drafting memo regarding trustee's interest in debtor's cause of action
04/21/98	\$100.00	1.0	\$100.00	Preparation of Motion to add N.J. as creditor
04/22/98	\$100.00	1.50	\$150.00	Preparation of Objection to Motion to Compromise and sell California cause of action; Telephone Conference with J. Krommenhoek on new claim addition
04/24/98	\$100.00	.40	\$40.00	Review of faxed documents from client on N. J. judgment; Preparation of fax to B. Peters
04/30/98	\$100.00	3.0	\$300.00	Outside conference with client and L. Sirhall; Hearing on Motion to Compromise, Motion to Add N.J. as creditor
04/30/98	\$100.00	.30	\$30.00	Telephone conference with J. Olofson and A. Sloan on outcome on Motions and status
05/12/98	\$100.00	1.0	\$100.00	Review of Motion to Alter or amend denial of compromise, affidavit, and memo; Telephone conference with client; Preparation of Order Allowing claim of N.J.; Letter to N.J.'s attorney as to claim and bankruptcy stay
05/12/98	\$100.00	.50	\$50.00	Telephone conference with Dave; Preparation of Objection to Motion to Alter or amend
05/18/98	\$100.00	.50	\$50.00	Telephone conference with client and Martin Barbato
05/19/98	\$100.00	.20	\$20.00	Review of objection by Wussler for special counsel for Krommenhoek

05/27/98	\$100.00	.30	\$30.00	Telephone conference with J. Krommenhoek on status of California suit; Telephone conference with client
05/29/98	\$100.00	.30	\$30.00	Telephone conference with J. Krommenhoek and B. Peters on appeal of compromise
06/01/98	\$100.00	.20	\$20.00	Telephone conference with J. Krommenhoek on status of California case
06/01/98	\$100.00	1.50	\$150.00	Preparation of Objection to Referral and Motion to Dismiss appeal as to Compromise
06/05/98	\$100.00	.30	\$30.00	Telephone conference with Dave on outcome of California action
06/19/98	\$100.00	.30	\$30.00	Calendar date of appeal briefs on Wussler appeal of compromise
07/06/98	\$100.00	.30	\$30.00	Review of Olofson's Appellee Brief on Wussler sanctions appeal; Preparation of fax to B. Peters with Motion to Compel
07/07/98	\$100.00	.30	\$30.00	Telephone conference with J. Krommenhoek on status of California decision
07/10/98	\$100.00	.20	\$20.00	Telephone conference with B. Peters on discovery requests
08/08/98	\$100.00	.50	\$50.00	Telephone conference with J. Krommenhoek; Review of letter from Krommenhoek as to California matters; Letter to D. Silva
08/08/98	\$100.00	.20	\$20.00	Review of letter from B. Peters on settlement offer

08/13/98	\$100.00	.30	\$30.00	Telephone conference with J. Gorski and court clerk as to Wussler appeal on compromise
09/08/98	\$100.00	.20	\$20.00	Telephone conference with Dave on status of suit from here
09/15/98	\$110.00	.50	\$55.00	Telephone conference with B. Peters on outcome of California suit; Telephone conference with client; Review of files for status of adversary and motion to compel; Telephone conference with M. Barbato
09/18/98	\$110.00	.50	\$55.00	Review of Order by Federal District Court on First Fidelity Bank Judgment and Motion to set aside; Letter to client; Telephone conference with M. Barbato
09/21/98	\$110.00	.30	\$33.00	Telephone conference with M. Barbato; Preparation of fax to Barbato
09/21/98	\$110.00	.30	\$33.00	Telephone conference with Barbato and client on California suit, transcript and judgment
09/29/98	\$110.00	.30	\$33.00	Review of notice of appeal by N.J. Bank; Office conference with client
09/30/98	\$110.00	.20	\$22.00	Preparation of fax to M. Barbato on California judgment
10/05/98	\$110.00	.30	\$33.00	Letter to D. Silva as to appeal decision on sanctions vs Wussler by trustee
11/03/98	\$110.00	.20	\$22.00	Telephone conference with J. Olofson on completion of California action and transcript

11/17/98	\$110.00	1.10	\$121.00	Telephone conference with J. Olofson on trial transcript; Telephone conferences with court clerk and client; Review of file as to issues of statute of limitations and res judicata Preparation of Motion to Compel
11/23/98	\$110.00	.20	\$22.00	Telephone conference with Dave on California transcript and status
04/01/99	\$115.00	.40	\$46.00	Review of Judgment from California Court; Letter to D. Silva on status conference
04/13/99	\$115.00	.90	\$103.50	Telephone conference with C. Richmond on possibility of appeal of attorney's fees in California action; Telephone conferences with J. Gorski on settlement proposal; Telephone conferences with court. Morton's office and client on change in plans for hearing
09/28/99	\$115.00	.20	\$23.00	Telephone conference with J. Krommenhoek on possibility of global settlement and issues of address
09/29/99	\$115.00	.30	\$34.50	Outside conference with J. Krommenhoek as to settlement discussions between trustee and Wussler
10/04/99	\$115.00	.20	\$23.00	Telephone conference with B. Peters on possible settlement with Wussler as to trustee sanctions
10/08/99	\$115.00	.40	\$46.00	Review of Motion to Compromise First Union Bank Judgment; Letter to client
11/10/99	\$115.00	.50	\$57.50	Hearing on trustees compromise with First Union Bank

11/16/99	\$115.00	.30	\$34.50	Review of order on First Union Compromise; Letter to client
GRAND TOTALS:		89.10	\$8,327.00	